AGENDA PLACE HOLDER






City of Cotati

DRAFT

Subject to approval. MINUTES
REGULAR CITY COUNCIL MEETING AND

JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL
AND COTATI REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY BOARD OF DIRECTORS
MARCH 26, 2008
City Council Chambers, City Hall, 201 W. Sierra Avenue

6:30 PM CLOSED SESSION
Mayor Gilardi called the meeting to order at 6:30 p.m.

Councilmembers present: Fox, Guardino, Minnis, Orchard and Mayor Gilardi
Staff present: Hayes, Rudnansky, Taylor, Thompson

There being no one wishing to speak on the closed session items, Mayor Gilardi adjourned to
closed session.

CALL TO ORDER (CITY COUNCIL CHAMBERS)
ADJOURNMENT TO CLOSED SESSION (CITY MANAGER’S OFFICE)

CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNCIL -- Existing Litigation (Subdivision a of
Government Code § 54956.9)
Name of Case: Pacific Legal Foundation v City of Cotati

CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATORS (Government Code § 54957.6)
Agency designated representative: Dianne Thompson, City Manager

Employee organization: Cotati Police Officers’ Association, and the Cotati Police
Officers’ Management Association.

7:00 PM
Mayor Gilardi called the regular meeting to order at 7:02 p.m.
ROLL CALL

Councilmembers present: Fox, Guardino, Minnis, Orchard and Mayor Gilardi
Staff present: Hayes, Lustig, O’Bid, Rudnansky, Stewart, Taylor, Thompson

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE AND MOMENT OF SILENCE

Mayor Gilardi led the pledge of allegiance and called for a moment of silence.



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 2 of 7

1.  APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF MARCH 12, 2008 REGULAR MEETING AND
NOTICE OF WAIVING OF READING OF ALL ORDINANCES INTRODUCED
AND/OR ADOPTED UNDER THIS AGENDA (Action)

Moved by Councilmember Orchard, seconded by Guardino and passed unanimously to
approve the minutes of the March 12, 2008 Regular meeting as modified (Vice Mayor
Guardino added that he abstained from item 8 because he did not believe he had enough
information about the project) and to waive the reading of all ordinances introduced and/or
adopted under this agenda.

APPROVAL OF FINAL AGENDA

Council concurred to pull item 4 for discussion prior to item 8.

Mayor Gilardi announced that item 10 would be continued to April 9, 2008.
CITY MANAGER’S REPORT

City Manager Dianne Thompson reported the following:

e The East Cotati Avenue water main replacement complete; the East Cotati Avenue
overlay project is scheduled to commence in April.

e The recruitment for the position of Administrative Secretary is complete and a top
candidate has been selected.

Cotati Community Cleanup is scheduled for April 19th and 20™

The ribbon cutting ceremony for the Cotati computer lab project took place on March 24.
CITIZEN BUSINESS

Anthony Adler of Cotati discussed a recent Press Democrat article regarding Sebastopol’s ban on
wireless internet service and stated that the company offering the free service has indicated
willingness to make the same offer to the city of Cotati.

Michele Berman of Cotati discussed a recent Sebastopol City Council meeting at which the
Council declined Sonic.net’s offer for free wireless internet service due to the concerns of
individuals who spoke at the meeting.

George Barich of Cotati addressed the Council regarding its March 12, 2008 decision to webcast
the City Council meeting. He commented regarding access to cable channels and requested that
the City re-negotiate cable franchise agreements.

Robert Coleman-Senghor of Cotatie requested that the City Council address the issue of Darfur.



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 3 of 7

Greg McClain of Cotati expressed concern that the bathroom at Sunflower park has been locked
and requested that Council look into the matter.

In response to concerns raised by the public speakers, Mayor Gilardi clarified that the cable
television is unable to provide a live feed for Council and that the Darfur resolution will be
scheduled for a City Council meeting in April.

City Manager Thompson indicated that city staff had spoken with Mr. McClain and are working
to get his concerns about the Sunflower park restroom resolved.

COUNCILMEMBER DIRECTION ON FUTURE AGENDA ITEMS (Discussion)
Council concurred to schedule an update on the animal control law.
ORAL AND WRITTEN COMMUNICATIONS

ANNOUNCEMENTS

The next Cotati Creek Critters” Community Planting Day is March 30 at 10:00 a.m.
Meet at City well lot #2 on Lakewood Avenue. For additional details and events call
792-4422 or visit their website at www.cotaticreekcritters.info.

Look for the new Spring/Summer Community Guide in your mailbox. The full
recreation schedule can be viewed on the city’s website www.ci.cotati.ca.us

The Ray Miller Community Center is now a site for Santa Rosa Junior College’s
Active Seniors Program. There is no fee for these classes. For a complete list check
the community guide or visit the city’s website at www.ci.cotati.ca.us

SONOMA STATE UNIVERSITY REPRESENTATIVE REPORT

Sonoma State University Student representative Jonathan T. White reported on
University activities and events.

STUDENT HONORARY MAYOR REPORT

Rachelle Dorn of Mountain Shadows Middle School discussed traffic during
construction on East Cotati Avenue, suggested that there be more activities for
teenagers and young adults and reported on school needs, activities and events.
Mayor Gilardi presented her with a certificate of commendation.

PROCLAMATIONS
2.  RECOGNIZING APRIL AS SEXUAL ASSAULT AWARENESS MONTH

Councilmember Fox read the proclamation and Mayor Gilardi presented this proclamation
to Chris Castillo, Executive Director of United Against Sexual Assault of Sonoma County.



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 4 of 7

George Barich of Cotati requested that Proclamations be moved to the end of the Council
meetings.

CONSENT CALENDAR

Mayor Gilardi announced that item 4 has been pulled from the Consent Calendar for discussion
and opened the floor to public comment regarding items 3, 5 and 6 on the Consent Calendar.

There being no one wishing to speak, Mayor Gilardi called for a motion.

Moved by Councilmember Orchard, seconded by Vice Mayor Guardino and passed unanimously
to approve items 3, 5 and 6 on the Consent Calendar as noted below.

3.

RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO SIGN A JOINT
POWERS AGREEMENT THAT ESTABLISHES A SEPARATE PUBLIC AGENCY
TO OPERATE AND MAINTAIN A PUBLIC SAFETY COMMUNICATION
SYSTEM IN SONOMA COUNTY (Action)

Resolution No. 08-07 entitled: A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF COTATI AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO SIGN A JOINT
POWERS AGREEMENT THAT ESTABLISHES A SEPARATE PUBLIC AGENCY TO
OPERATE AND MAINTAIN A PUBLIC SAFETY COMMUNICATION SYSTEM IN
SONOMA COUNTY.

Item 4 was pulled for discussion after item 7 below.

5.

RECEIVE AND FILE PROPOSED BUDGET FROM THE SANTA ROSA
SUBREGIONAL SYSTEM FOR FISCAL YEAR 2008/2009 (Action)

Motion receiving and filing the proposed budget prepared by the Santa Rosa Subregional
System.

ACCEPTANCE OF PUBLIC IMPROVEMENTS NOTICE OF COMPLETION FOR
THE GILMAN SUBDIVISION (850 WEST COTATI AVENUE, PA# 04/02) (Action)

Motion accepting the public improvements and authorizes filing of the Notice of
Completion (NOC) for the Gilman Subdivision located at 850 West Cotati Avenue, PA#
04/12.

PUBLIC HEARINGS

7.

INTRODUCTION OF AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AMENDMENTS TO THE
CALIFORNIA BUILDING AND FIRE CODES (Action)

Interim Chief Building Official Joe Kagan presented the staff report.
Fire Chief Traynor addressed the Council in support of the proposal.

Mayor Gilardi opened the public hearing.



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 5 of 7

Michelle Berman of Cotati spoke in support of the proposal, noting that she is a trained fire
sprinkler installer and understands the safety issues.

There being no one else wishing to speak, Mayor Gilardi closed the public hearing.

Moved by Councilmember Orchard and seconded by Councilmember Minnis to introduce
an ordinance of the City Council of the City of Cotati amending Chapter 14.04 of the
Cotati Municipal Code in its entirety and adopting by reference the following Codes: 2007
Edition of the California Building Standard Code, California Code of Regulations Title 24,
Parts 1 through 6, 9, 10 and 12 ; 2006 Edition of International Property Maintenance Code;
2006 Uniform Swimming Pool and Hot Tub Code; 2006 Edition of the International
Existing Building Code including tables and appendixes. The proposed ordinance will also
include amendments to said codes based on local climatic, geologic and topographical
conditions.

Yes: 5 No: O Abstain: 0

REGULAR AGENDA

4.

REPLACEMENT OF LA PLAZA PARK PLAYGROUND EQUIPMENT (Action)

Councilmember Minnis recused herself from this item because she owns property within
five hundred feet of La Plaza Park. She left the chamber during discussion of this item.

Assistant to the City Manager Marsha Sue Lustig presented the staff report and responded
to questions from the Council.

Mayor Gilardi opened the floor to public comments.
George Barich of Cotati requested additional information regarding the equipment and cost.

Mayor Gilardi responded to Mr. Barich and noted that the staff report contained renderings
of the proposed equipment.

Moved by Councilmember Fox and seconded by Councilmember Orchard to approve the
replacement of La Plaza Park Playground Equipment with an amount not to exceed
$16,167.

Yes: 4 No: O Abstain: 1 (Minnis)
PLASTIC BAG INFORMATIONAL UPDATE (Discussion)

City Engineer/Director of Public Works Damien O’Bid reported on the use of plastic bags
and their impact to the environment.

Discussion ensued regarding voluntary and mandatory ban, the possibility of litigation from
plastic bag manufacturers, recycling of plastic bags by waste haulers, talking to local
businesses and the Chamber of Commerce about discontinuing the use of plastic bags on a
voluntary basis



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 6 of 7

Mayor Gilardi explained that the Mayors’ and Councilmembers’ Association has discussed
this issue and may form a subcommittee with members from each city to discuss forming a
position.

Mayor Gilardi opened the floor to public comments.

Neil Hancock addressed the Council, noting that BBC America has been running a program
about the damage of plastic films to the environment.

Jenny Blaker of Cotati discussed the effects of plastic bags on waterways and oceans. She
indicated that education and outreach are effective in raising public awareness of this issue.

George Barich of Cotati suggested combining the efforts against plastic bag issue with
efforts against styrofoam and noted that he had worked with Redwood Empire Disposal to
find a drop-off point in Cotati for styrofoam.

Robert Coleman-Senghor of Cotati requested clarification on who had challenged bans on
plastic bags with litigation and what the issues were. He suggested that users of the plastic
bags be educated about plastic bags and the broader issue of sustainability.

Michelle Berman of Cotati reminded the Council that in the past paper bags were used for
produce in stores and longer ago there were no containers at all. She indicated her belief
that plastic bags and Styrofoam should be banned and that our culture should be more
sustainable.

There being no one else wishing to speak, Mayor Gilardi closed the public comment
period.

Discussion ensued regarding the Mayors’ and Councilmembers’ ideas about cities working
together on this issue, educating residents by including an insert in their water bills,
working with members of the Chamber of Commerce or forming an ad hoc committee with
Rohnert park to speak with individual store owners in both cities, regional sustainability,
resources such as www.seegreen.org, and the difficulty of integrating the various waste
issues.

Councilmember Orchard indicated that the Plastic Bags Association is the entity that has
threatened litigation against bans.

City Engineer O’Bid said that the basis of the litigation is the categorical exemption under
CEQA and noted that the citizens of Fairfax are attempting to vote in a ban because ballot
initiatives are exempt under CEQA.

City Attorney Rudnansky addressed CEQA issues on plastic bag bans.

Council concurred to schedule a future discussion regarding adoption of a resolution on
regional sustainability and to encourage each city in the Mayors’ and Councilmembers’
Association to institute voluntary bans all in the same month, which would be likely to gain
the attention of the press and would be a step towards regional sustainability.



City Council Minutes
March 26, 2008
Page 7 of 7

ADJOURNMENT OF REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY COUNCIL TO JOINT
MEETING OF CITY COUNCIL AND COTATI REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY BOARD
OF DIRECTORS

Mayor Gilardi adjourned to the joint meeting at 8:45 p.m.
CALL TO ORDER AND ROLL CALL FOR JOINT MEETING
Mayor/Chair Gilardi called the joint meeting to order at 8:45 p.m.

Members present: Fox, Guardino, Minnis, Orchard, and Chair/Mayor Gilardi
Staff present: Hayes, O’Bid Rudnansky, Taylor, Thompson

CONSENT CALENDAR

Chair/Mayor Gilardi announced that item 10 was removed from the agenda and opened the floor
for public comment.

There being no one wishing to speak, Mayor Gilardi closed the public comment period.

Moved by Member Orchard, seconded by Vice Chair/Vice Mayor Guardino and passed
unanimously to approve item 9 on the Consent Calendar as follows:

9.  WARRANTS AND AUDITED CLAIMS (Action)

Motion receiving and filing Warrants and Audited Claims for February 29th, 2008 — March
13th, 2008.

10. RESOLUTION APPOINTING CITY ATTORNEY AND APPROVING AND
AUTHORIZING EXECUTION OF CITY ATTORNEY CONTRACT (Action)

This item was continued to the April 9, 2008 City Council meeting.
CITY COUNCIL REPORTS AND COMMENTS (Discussion)

Councilmembers reported on recent and upcoming activities, including reports from meetings
attended at City expense.

ADJOURNMENT
Mayor Gilardi adjourned the meeting at 9:50 p.m. to closed session as noted above.

Respectfully submitted,

Deputy City Clerk y:\city_mgr\council\cc agendas\agn08\080122ccagenda.doc






Item No. 2

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Reject Claim for Damages Against the City of Cotati — Luisa Furtado
Date: April 9, 2008
Written By: Jone Hayes, Administrative Services Director

Recommendation:

It is recommended by the Department of Administrative Services that Council reject the claim of
Luisa Furtado and direct staff to forward the claim to the Redwood Empire Municipal Insurance
Fund (REMIF).

Background:

On February 20, 2008, a claim for damages was received from Luisa Furtado.

Analysis/Discussion:

Staff has, in accordance with policy, contacted the City’s insurance pool, REMIF. Jeff Davis has
advised staff to place the claim on the Council’s agenda with the recommendation that it be
rejected.

Financial Considerations

None.

Environmental Issues

None.

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\RejectClaimFurtado.sr.doc






Item No. 3

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Adoption of an Ordinance Adopting Amendments to the California Building
and Fire Codes

Date: April 9, 2008

Written By: Joseph Kagan, Interim Building Official

Recommendation

It is recommended by the Interim Building Official that the City Council adopt an ordinance of the
City Council of the City of Cotati amending Chapter 14.04 of the Cotati Municipal Code in its
entirety and adopting by reference the following Codes: 2007 Edition of the California Building
Standard Code, California Code of Regulations Title 24, Parts 1 through 6, 9, 10 and 12 ; 2006
Edition of International Property Maintenance Code; 2006 Uniform Swimming Pool and Hot Tub
Code; 2006 Edition of the International Existing Building Code including tables and appendixes.
The proposed ordinance will also include amendments to said codes based on local climatic,
geologic and topographical conditions.

Background

The State of California adopted the new International Codes with amendments on July 1, 2007.
Local agencies are required by statute to adopt the new State Codes with local amendments, if any.

At its March 26, 2008 regular meeting the City Council conducted a public hearing and
subsequently introduced an ordinance to adopt the new State Codes with local amendments.

Analysis/Discussion

California Building Code:

The International Codes have changes from the prior Uniform Codes and require
some amendments for local use.

California Fire Code:

This adoption process is the first in Sonoma County where ALL Fire Agencies are
attempting to adopt exactly the same amendments to the California Fire Code. This
common language is designed to give developers, contractors and citizens consistent
requirements and code language, which should streamline the permitting process and
require less education for the building community. These amendments have been reviewed
by the stakeholder groups during the entire code adoption review process and by receiving

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\BuildingFireCode.sr.doc



valuable feedback, have made corresponding changes to the code language. These
amendments have been endorsed by the Sonoma County Fire Prevention Officer’s
Association and the Sonoma County Fire Chief’s Association.

The one major change to this code is the strengthening of the fire sprinkler requirements for
new construction. This adoption requires all new commercial and residential structures to
have installed an automatic fire sprinkler system, with exceptions for small accessory
structures and outbuildings. Today, the current code requires fire sprinklers in all new
commercial and residential construction over 4,000 square feet in size. Fire sprinklers are
by far the most effective and practical way to provide fire protection in structures. The
following are pros and cons regarding fire sprinklers:

Pros:
. Will control and/or extinguish the fire prior to fire department arrival.
. Fire deaths in dwellings are reduced to almost zero.

. Reduce Fire Damage by 95%.
. Reduce Water Damage by 90%.

. Fire suppression is available 24 hours a day, 7 days a week.

. Reduce homeowner’s insurance rates.

. Reduce Firefighter injuries.

Cons:

. Costs approximately $2.00 to $2.50 per square foot in residential occupancies.

1500 square foot dwelling would cost approximately $3,000 to $3,750 to have
sprinklers installed.

Currently, the entire unincorporated area of Sonoma County, along with the cities of
Petaluma, Healdsburg, Sonoma, Cloverdale, Windsor, Sebastopol, Santa Rosa and Rohnert
Park require fire sprinklers in all new construction. Cotati is now being asked to adopt the
same fire sprinkler regulations. Residential fire sprinklers although not required, have been
very common in Cotati and have been required on a majority of new construction, due
mainly to fire department access requirements.

Other amendments to the California Fire Code involve fire department access, hydrant
spacing and water supply.

Uniform Housing, Abatement for Dangerous Buildings and Administrative Codes:

The Uniform Housing, Abatement for Dangerous Buildings and Administrative Codes are
no longer in publication. Portions of these codes have been incorporated into the local
amendments to provide continuity in enforcement procedures.

Existing Structures, Damages and Repairs:

The existing structures, damages and repairs portion of this ordinance is intended to be a
component of our Local Hazard Mitigation Plan. Currently, Title 24 of the California Code

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\BuildingFireCode.sr.doc



Adoption of Amendments to the California Building and Fire Codes
April 9, 2008
Page 3 of 3

of Regulations does not provide for damaged structures to be repaired or reconstructed to a
structurally safe level, accounting for upgrades in wind and seismic standards. The
ordinance was drafted by a consortium of statewide organizations (California Building
Officials, California Office of Emergency Services, California State Seismic Commission,
and other interested stakeholders) to permit jurisdictions to assist building owners in
repairing their structures to reasonably safe levels based upon current industry standards.

Financial Considerations

Staff will be bringing forward the related revisions to fees in a resolution in subsequent meeting.

Environmental Issues

None.

Attachments:
Ordinance as introduced

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\BuildingFireCode.sr.doc



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI AMENDING
CHAPTER 14.04 OF THE COTATI MUNICIPAL CODE IN ITS ENTIRETY AND, ADOPTING
BY REFERENCE THE FOLLOWING CODES: 2007 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, CALIFORNIA CODE OF REGULATIONS TITLE 24, PART 1 -
2007 CALIFORNIA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE; PART 2 - 2007 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE
BASED ON THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE; PART 3 - 2007 CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE BASED ON THE 2005 NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE; PART 4 - 2007
CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE BASED ON THE 2006 UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE;
PART 5 - 2007 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE BASED ON THE 2006 UNIFORM PLUMBING
CODE; PART 6 - 2007 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE; PART 9 - 2007 CALIFORNIA FIRE
CODE, BASED ON THE 2006 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE; PART 10 -
2007 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE BASED ON THE 2006 INTERNATIONAL
EXISTING BUILDING CODE; PART 12 - 2007 CALIFORNIA REFERENCED STANDARDS
CODE, INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, 2006 EDITION; APPENDIX
CHAPTERS 1 (ADMINISTRATION), J (GRADING) AMENDED BY DELETING J103.2
EXCEPTIONS 1 H (SIGNS) AND | (PATIO COVERS) OF THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE;
APPENDIX CHAPTER 1 (ADMINISTRATION) AND APPENDIX CHAPTER A (CODE
STANDARD 6-2) OF THE CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE; AND APPENDIX CHAPTER 1
(ADMINISTRATION) OF THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE AS PUBLISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; THE 2006 EDITION OF THE UNIFORM SWIMMING
POOL, SPA AND HOT TUB CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL ASSOCIATION
OF PLUMBING AND MECHANICAL OFFICIALS

The City Council of the City of Cotati does ordain as follows:

Section 1: Chapter 14.04, “Uniform Codes”, of the City of Cotati Municipal Code is amended in its
entirety to read as follows:

14.04.010 Adoption of codes by reference

The Uniform Codes and the International Codes together with any amendments thereof, as hereinafter
set forth in the Ordinance, are adopted and made part of this Ordinance, together with amendments
and additions to the various codes; providing penalties for the violation thereof and repealing all
ordinances in conflict therewith.

14.04.20 Copies on file

One certified copy of each of the Codes so adopted, along with any amendment thereto, shall be kept
on file for the use and examination by the public and located at the City of Cotati building department.

14.04.025 Findings

The City Council of the City of Cotati finds that in order to best protect the health, safety and welfare
of the citizens of the City of Cotati, the standards of building within the City must conform with state
law except where local conditions warrant more restrictive regulations. Therefore, the City Council
desires to adopt the current state building and fire codes, contained in California Building Standards



Code Title 24, and other uniform codes governing the construction and regulation of buildings and
structures with the modifications and amendments contained herein.

Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code section 17958.7, the City Council makes the factual
findings hereto and incorporated herein by reference, and finds that the amendments made in this
ordinance to the California Building Standards Code Title 24, are reasonably necessary because of the
local climatic, geological or topographical conditions described in the following:

The City wishes to adopt by reference the following codes, with such amendments as may be
necessary to conform to local climatic, geologic, and topographical conditions:

California Code of Regulations Title-24

14.04.030 Part 1 — 2007 California Administrative Code;

14.04.040 Part 2 — 2007 California Building Code, Volume 1 and 2, including
Appendix Chapters 1 (Administration), J (Grading) amended to
delete J103.2 Exception #1, Chapters H and I;

14.04.050 Part 3 — 2007 California Electrical Code;

14.04.060 Part 4 — 2007 California Mechanical Code including Chapters 1 and A,
B, C, and D;

14.04.070 Part 5 — 2007 California Plumbing Code including Appendix
Chapter 1 (Administration), and Chapters A, B, D, G, | and K;

14.40.080 Part 6 — 2007 California Energy Code;

14.04.090 Part 9 — 2007 California Fire Code;

14.04.100 Part 10 — 2007 California Existing Building Code;
14.04.110 Part 12 — 2007 California References Standard Code;
14.04.120 International Property Maintenance Code;

14.04.130 2006 Edition of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub
Code;

14.01.140 2006 Edition of the International Existing Building Code.

Under the provisions of Section 17958.5 of the Health and Safety Code, local amendments must be
based on climatic, geologic and topographical conditions. The following findings address each of
these situations and present the local conditions which, either singularly or in combination, justify the
amendments to be adopted:

A. CLIMATE: The City, on average, experiences an approximate annual rainfall of 40
inches. This rainfall can normally be expected between October and April. During the
winter months, the City may experience periods of heavy rain, which causes local
flooding. Winter storms are often accompanied by high winds, which have uprooted

Ordinance No.
Page 2 of 44



trees and damaged power lines. The City has also experienced periods of heavy fog,
which has delayed the responding fire apparatus and prevented early discovery of
structure fires. During the dry period, temperatures range from 70 degrees to over 100
degrees. These temperatures are often accompanied by light to gusty winds, which
when coupled with highly flammable vegetation, can cause uncontrollable fires. With
increased development spreading into the brush covered foothill area, wind driven fires
could have severe consequences, as has been demonstrated on several occasions
throughout the state.

GEOLOGIC: The City is susceptible to seismic hazards resulting from movement
along any one of several known faults in the area. The most serious direct earthquake
hazard threat is from the damage or collapse of buildings and other structures due to
ground movement. In addition to damage caused by earthquakes, there is the
possibility of earthquake-induced fires starting because of damage to gas lines, power
lines or heat producing appliances and the unavailability of water for fire control due to
broken water mains. In the event of a major earthquake many areas of the City may
not be accessible to emergency equipment and, if bridges or roads are damaged, the
City may be isolated from outside assistance.

TOPOGRAPHICAL.: The City is divided by Highway 101 and railroad right-of-way.
The railroad and freeway create barriers, which obstruct traffic patterns and delay
response time for fire equipment. The water supply within the City is directly affected
by the topographical layout. The City water system is currently pressured from the
Sonoma County Water Agency aqueduct inter-tie. In the event of a major catastrophe,
the City does not have an elevated water storage system to supply pressured water to
the City fire hydrants.

SUMMARY: The above local climatic, geologic and topographical conditions increase
the magnitude, exposure, accessibility problems and fire hazards presented to the City
of Cotati. A fire following an earthquake has the potential of causing greater loss of life
and damage than the earthquake itself. The majority of the City’s industrial areas are
located in the highest seismic risk zones, which also contain the largest concentration
of hazardous materials. Hazardous materials, particularly toxic gases, could pose the
greatest threat to the largest number of persons, should a significant seismic event
occur. The City of Cotati’s resources would have to be prioritized to mitigate the
greatest threat, and may be unavailable for vegetation or structure fires.

Other variables that may tend to intensify the situation include:

1. The extent of damage to the water system;

2. The extent of isolation due to bridge and/or freeway overpass collapse;

3. The extent of roadway damage and/or amount of debris blocking

roadways;

Climatic conditions (hot, dry weather with high winds);

5. Time of day will influence the amount of traffic on roadways and could
intensify the risk to life during normal business hours; and,

e

Ordinance No.
Page 3 of 44



6. The availability of timely mutual aid or assistance from the neighboring
departments which will likely have similar emergencies at the same
time.

7. The large portions of dwelling with wood shingle roof coverings, which
will increase the likelihood of conflagrations.

E. CONCLUSION: Local climatic, geologic and topographical conditions impact fire
suppression efforts and the frequency, spread, intensity, and the size of fire involving
structures in this community. Further, they impact potential damage to all structures
from earthquake and subsequent fire. Therefore, it is found to be necessary that the
California Building Standard Code Title 24 be amended to mitigate the effects of these
conditions.

14.04.030 California Administrative Code

2007 Edition of the California Administrative Code also known as the California Building
Standards Administration Code as published by the Building Standard Commission is adopted by
reference.

14.04.040 California Building Code

The Council hereby adopts by reference the California Code of Regulations Title-24 Part 2 Volume
1 and 2 and the current edition of the International Building Code, the 2007 Edition Volumes 1, and 2
and the Appendices thereof as published by the International Code Council, including the generic fire-
resistive assemblies listed Fire Resistive Design Manual GA-600, published by the Gypsum
Association, as referenced in table numbers 720.1, 720.2 and 720.3 of the specified International
Building Code including the Appendix Chapter 1, and Appendix Chapter H and Chapter I, with the
following amendments:

1. Appendix Chapter 1 Section 105.2, exception 1 shall be amended to read as
follows: One-story detached accessory buildings used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses, and similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet,
(1 1.15m2). The height of the one story detached accessory building shall not exceed 12
feet at any point or as specified by local zoning ordinance.

2. Appendix Chapter 1 Section 10.5.2, exception 6 shall be amended to read as
follows: Platforms, decks, sidewalks, and driveways not more than 30 inches (762mm)
above adjacent grade, not over any basement or story below and are not part of an
accessible route.

3. Appendix Chapter 1 Section 108.4 shall be amended to read as follows: Work
commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any work on a
building, structure, electrical, gas, mechanical or plumbing system before obtaining the
necessary permits shall be subject to a fee establish by the building official that shall be
in addition to the required permit fees. An investigation fee, in addition to the permit
fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The

Ordinance No.
Page 4 of 44



investigation fee shall be at least equal to and not to exceed five time the permit fee
required by this code. The minimum investigation fee shall be set forth in the fee
schedule adopted by this jurisdiction. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any
penalty prescribed by law.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 109.7 shall be amended to read as follows:
Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection
when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or when
corrections called for are not made.

This section is not to be interpreted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is
rejected for failure to comply with the requirements of this code, but as controlling the
practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for such inspection or re-
inspection.

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or
otherwise available on the work site, or the approved plans are not readily available to
the inspector. For failure to provide access on the date for which inspection is
requested, or for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building official.

To obtain a reinspection, the applicant shall file an application therefore in writing on a
form furnished for that purpose and pay the reinspection fee in accordance with Table 1
or as set forth in the fee schedule adopted by the jurisdiction.

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the
work will be performed until the required fees have been paid.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 113.4 shall be amended to read as follows: Violation
penalties. Any persons who violates a provision of this code or fails to comply with
any of the requirements thereof or who erects, constructs, alters or repairs a building or
structure in violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the
building official, or of a permit or certificate issued under the provisions of this code,
shall be subject to penalties as prescribed by law. An investigation fee, in addition to
the permit fee, shall be collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued.
The investigation fee shall be at least equal to and not to exceed five time the permit
fee required by this code. The minimum investigation fee shall be set forth in the fee
schedule adopted by this jurisdiction. The payment of such investigation fee shall not
exempt any person from compliance with all other provisions of this code nor from any
penalty prescribed by law.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 115 — Unsafe Structures and Equipment shall  be
amended to read as follows:

Section 115.6 — General.

Ordinance No.
Page 5 of 44



For the purpose of this code, certain terms, phrases, words and their derivations
shall be construed as specified in either this chapter or as specified in the Building
Code. Where terms are not defined, they shall have their ordinary accepted
meanings within the context with which they are used. Webster’s Third
International Dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged, copyright 1986, shall
be construed as providing ordinary accepted meanings. Words used in the
singular include the plural and the plural the singular. Words used in the
masculine gender include the feminine and the feminine the masculine.

Building Code is the International Building Code promulgated by the International
Code, as adopted by this jurisdiction.

Dangerous Building is any building or structure deemed to be dangerous under the
provisions of Section 115.7 of this code.

Substandard Building is any building or portion thereof that is determined to be an
unsafe building in accordance with Section 115 of the Building Code, or any building
or portion thereof, including any dwelling unit, guest room or suite of rooms, or the
premises on which the same is located, in which there exists any of the conditions
referenced in this section to an extent that endangers the life, limb, health, property,
safety or welfare of the public or the occupants thereof, shall be deemed and hereby are
declared to be substandard buildings.

Section 115.7 — Dangerous Building. For the purpose of this code, any building or
structure which has any or all of the conditions or defects hereinafter described shall be
deemed to be a dangerous building, provided that such conditions or defects exist to the
extent that the life, health, property or safety of the public or its occupants are
endangered.

1. Whenever any door, aisle, passageway, stairway or other means of exit
is not of sufficient width or size or is not so arranged as to provide safe
and adequate means of exit in case of fire or panic.

2. Whenever the walking surface of any aisle, passageway, stairway or
other means of exit is so warped, worn, loose, torn, or otherwise unsafe
as to not provide safe and adequate means of exit in case or fire or
panic.

3. Whenever the stress in any materials, member or portion thereof, due to
all dead and live loads, is more than one and one half times the working
stress or stresses allowed in the Building Code for new buildings of
similar structure, purpose or location.

4. Whenever any portion thereof has been damaged by fire, earthquake,
wind, flood or by any other cause, to such an extent that the structural
strength or stability thereof is materially less than it was before such

Ordinance No.
Page 6 of 44



10.

11.

12.

catastrophe and is less than the minimum requirements of the Building
Code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose or location.

Whenever any portion or member or appurtenance thereof is likely to
fail, or to become detached or dislodged, or to collapse and thereby
injure persons or damage property.

Whenever any portion of a building, or any member, appurtenance or
ornamentation on the exterior thereof is not of sufficient strength or
stability, or is not so anchored, attached or fastened in place so as to be
capable of resisting a wind pressure of one half of that specified in the
Building Code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose or
location without exceeding the working stresses permitted in the
Building Code for such buildings.

Whenever any portion thereof has wracked, warped, buckled or settled
to such an extent that walls or other structural portions have materially
less resistance to winds or earthquakes than is required in the case of
similar new construction.

Whenever the building or structure, or any portion thereof, because of
(i) dilapidation, deterioration or decay; (ii) faulty construction; (iii) the
removal, movement or instability of any portion of the ground necessary
for the purpose of supporting such building; (iv) the deterioration, decay
or inadequacy of its foundation; or (v) any other cause, is likely to
partially or completely collapse.

Whenever, for any reason, the building or structure, or any portion
thereof, is manifestly unsafe for the purpose for which it is being used.

Whenever the exterior walls or other vertical structural members list,
lean or buckle to such an extent that a plumb line passing through the
center of gravity does not fall inside the middle one third of the base.

Whenever the building or structure, exclusive of the foundation, shows
33 percent or more damage or deterioration of its supporting member or
members, or 50 percent damage or deterioration of its nonsupporting
members, enclosing or outside walls or coverings.

Whenever the building or structure has been so damaged by fire, wind,
earthquake or flood, or has become so dilapidated or deteriorated as to
become (i) an attractive nuisance to children; (ii) a harbor for vagrants,
criminals or immoral persons; or as to (iii) enable persons to resort
thereto for the purpose of committing unlawful or immoral acts.

Ordinance No.
Page 7 of 44



13.

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

Whenever any building or structure has been constructed, exists or is
maintained in violation of any specific requirement or prohibition
applicable to such building or structure provided by the building
regulations of this jurisdiction, as specified in the Building Code or
Housing Code, or any law or ordinance of this state or jurisdiction
relating to the condition, location or structure of buildings.

Whenever any building or structure which, whether or not erected in
accordance with all applicable laws and ordinances, has in any
nonsupporting part, member or portion less than 50 percent, or in any
supporting part, member or portions less than 66 percent of the (i)
strength, (ii) fire-resisting qualities or characteristics, or (iii) weather-
resisting qualities or characteristics required by law in the case of a
newly constructed building of like area, height and occupancy in the
same location.

Whenever a building or structure, used or intended to be used for
dwelling purposes, because of inadequate maintenance, dilapidation,
decay, damage, faulty construction or arrangement, inadequate light, air
or sanitation facilities, or otherwise, is determined by the health officer
to be unsanitary, unfit for human habitation or in such a condition that is
likely to cause sickness or disease.

Whenever any building or structure, because of obsolescence,
dilapidated condition, deterioration, damage, inadequate exits, lack of
sufficient fire-resistive construction, faulty electric wiring, gas
connections or heating apparatus, or other cause, is determined by the
fire marshal to be a fire hazard.

Whenever any building or structure is in such a condition as to
constitute a public nuisance known to the common law or in equity
jurisprudence.

Whenever any portion of a building or structure remains on a site after
the demolition or destruction of the building or structure or whenever
any building or structure is abandoned for a period in excess of six
months so as to constitute such building or portion thereof an attractive
nuisance or hazard to the public.

115.8 Substandard Building.

Any building or portion thereof that is determined to be an unsafe building in
accordance with Section 115 of the Building Code, or any building or portion thereof,
including any dwelling unit, guest room or suite of rooms, or the premises on which the
same is located, in which there exists any of the conditions referenced in this section to
an extent that endangers the life, limb, health, property, safety or welfare of the public

Ordinance No.
Page 8 of 44



or the occupants thereof, shall be deemed and hereby are declared to be substandard

buildings.

115.8.1 Inadequate Sanitation.
Buildings or portions thereof shall be deemed substandard when they are
unsanitary. Inadequate sanitation shall include, but not limited to, the following:

1.

10.

11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Lack of or improper water closet, lavatory, bathtub or
shower in a dwelling unit or lodging house.

Lack of or improper water closets, lavatories, and bathtubs or
showers per number of guests in a hotel.

Lack of or improper kitchen sink in a dwelling unit.

Lack of hot and cold running water to plumbing fixtures in a
hotel.

Lack of hot and cold running water to plumbing fixtures in a
dwelling unit or lodging house.

Lack of adequate heating facilities.
Lack of or improper operation of required ventilation equipment.

Lack of minimum amounts of natural light and ventilation
required by this code.

Room and space dimensions less than required by this code.
Lack of required electrical lighting.
Dampness of habitable rooms.

Infestation or insects, vermin or rodents as determined by the
health officer.

General dilapidation or improper maintenance.
Lack of connection to required sewage disposal system.

Lack of adequate garbage and rubbish storage and removal

facilities as determined by the health officer.

115.8.2 Structural Hazards.

Ordinance No.
Page 9 of 44



Buildings or portions thereof shall be deemed substandard when they are or
contain structural hazards. Structural hazards shall include, but not limited to,
the following:

1. Deteriorated or inadequate foundations.
2. Defective or deteriorated flooring or floor supports.
3. Flooring or floor supports of insufficient size to carry

imposed loads with safety.

4, Members of walls, partitions, or other vertical supports that split,
lean, list or buckle due to defective material or deterioration.

5. Members of walls, partitions or other vertical supports that are of
insufficient size to carry imposed loads with safety.

6. Members of ceilings, roofs, ceiling and roof supports, or other
horizontal members that sag, split or buckle due to defective
material deterioration.

7. Members of ceilings, roofs, ceiling and roof supports, or other
horizontal members that are of insufficient size to carry imposed
loads with safety.

8. Fireplaces or chimneys that list, bulge or settle due to defective
material or deterioration.

9. Fireplaces or chimneys that are of insufficient size or strength to
carry imposed loads with safety.

115.8.3 Nuisance. Buildings or portions thereof in which there exists any
nuisance as defined in this code are deemed substandard buildings.

115.8.4 Hazardous Electrical Wiring. Electrical wiring that was installed in
violation of code requirements in effect at the time of installation or electrical
wiring not installed in accordance with generally accepted construction
practices in areas where no codes were in effect or that has not been maintained
in good condition or that is not being used in a safe manner shall be considered
substandard.

115.8.5 Hazardous Plumbing. Plumbing that was installed in violation of code
requirements in effect at the time of installation or plumbing not installed in
accordance with generally accepted construction practices in areas where no
codes were in effect or that has not been maintained in good condition or that is

Ordinance No.
Page 10 of 44



not free of cross-connections or siphonage between fixtures shall be considered
substandard.

115.8.6 Hazardous Mechanical Equipment. Mechanical equipment that was
installed in violation of code requirements in effect at the time of installation or
mechanical equipment not installed in accordance with generally accepted
construction practices in areas where no codes were in effect or that has not
been maintained in good and safe condition shall be considered substandard.

115.8.7 Faulty Weather Protection. Buildings or portions thereof shall be
considered substandard when they have faulty weather protection, which shall
include, but not be limited to, the following:

1. Deteriorated, crumbling or loose plaster.

2. Deteriorated or ineffective waterproofing of exterior walls, roof,
foundations or floors, including broken windows or doors.

3. Defective or lack of weather protection for exterior wall
coverings, including lack of paint, or weathering due to lack of
paint or other approved protective covering.

4. Broken, rotted, split or buckled exterior wall coverings or roof
coverings.

115.8.8 Fire Hazard. Any building or portion thereof, device, apparatus,
equipment, combustible waste, or vegetation that, in the opinion of the chief of
the fire department, is in such a condition as to cause a fire or explosion or
provide a ready fuel to augment the spread and intensity of fire or explosion
arising from any cause shall be considered substandard.

115.8.9 Faulty Materials of Construction. The use of materials of
construction, except those that are specifically allowed or approved by this code
and the Building Code, and that have been adequately maintained in good and
safe condition, shall cause a building to be substandard.

115.8.10 Hazardous or Insanitary Premises. The accumulation of weeds,
vegetation, junk, dead organic matter, debris, garbage, offal, rat harborages,
stagnant water, combustible materials and similar materials or conditions on a
premises constitutes fire, health or safety hazards that shall be abated in
accordance with the procedure specified in Chapter 11 of this code.

115.8.11 Inadequate Exits. Except for those buildings or portions thereof that
have been provided with adequate exit facilities conforming to the provisions of
this code, buildings or portions thereof whose exit facilities were installed in
violation of code requirements in effect at the time of their construction or

Ordinance No.
Page 11 of 44



whose exit facilities have not been increased in number or width in relation to
any increase in occupant load due to alterations, additions or change in use or
occupancy subsequent to the time of construction shall be considered
substandard.

Notwithstanding compliance with code requirements in effect at the time of
their construction, buildings or portions thereof shall be considered substandard
when the building official finds that an unsafe condition exists through an
improper location of exits, a lack of adequate number or width of exits, or when
other conditions exist that are dangerous to human life.

115.8.12 Inadequate Fire-protection or Firefighting Equipment. Buildings
or portions thereof shall be considered substandard when they are not provided
with the fire-resistive construction or fire-extinguishing systems or equipment
required by this code, except those buildings or portions thereof that conformed
with all applicable laws at the time of their construction and whose fire-resistive
integrity and fire-extinguishing systems or equipment have been adequately
maintained and improved in relation to any increase in occupant load, alteration
or addition, or any change in occupancy.

115.8.13 Improper Occupancy. All buildings or portions thereof occupied for
living, sleeping, cooking or dining purposes that were not designed or intended
to be used for such occupancies shall be considered substandard.

Section 115.9 Notices and Orders of Building Official

115.9.1 Commencement of Proceedings. When the building official has
inspected or caused to be inspected any building and has found and determined
that such building is a dangerous building, the building official shall commence
proceedings to cause the repair, vacation or demolition of the building.

115.9.2 Notice and Order. The building official shall issue a notice and order
directed to the record owner of the building. The notice and order shall contain:

1. The street address and legal description sufficient for
identification of the premises upon which the building is located.

2. A statement that the building official has found the building to
be dangerous with a brief and concise description of the
conditions found to render the building dangerous under the
provisions of Section 302 of this code.

3. A statement of the action required to be taken as determined by
the building official.

Ordinance No.
Page 12 of 44



3.1  Ifthe building official has determined that the building or
structure must be repaired, the order shall require that all
required permits be secured thereof and the work
physically commenced within such time (not to exceed
60 days from the date of the order) and completed within
such time as the building official shall determine is
reasonable under all of the circumstances.

3.2 Ifthe building official has determined that the building or
structure must be vacated, the order shall require that the
building or structure shall be vacated within a time
certain from the date of the order as determined by the
building official to be reasonable.

3.3 Ifthe building official has determined that the building or
structure must be demolished, the order shall require that
the building be vacated within such time as the building
official shall determine is reasonable (not to exceed 60
days from the date of order); that all required permits be
secured there for within 60 days from the date of order;
and that the demolition be completed within such time as
the building official shall determine reasonable.

Statements advising that if any required repair or demolition
work (without vacation also being required) is not commenced
within the time specified, the building official (i) will order the
building vacated and posted to prevent further occupancy until
the work is completed, and (ii) may proceed to cause the work to
be done and charge the costs thereof against the property or its
owner.

Statements advising (i) that any person having any record title or
legal interest in the building may appeal from the notice and
order any action of the building official to the board of appeals,
provided the appeal is made in writing as provided in this code
and filed with the building official within 30 days from the date
of service of such notice and order; and (ii) that failure to appeal
will constitute a waiver of all right to an administrative hearing
and determination of the matter.

115.9.3 Service of Notice and Order. The notice and order, and any amended
or supplemental notice and order, shall be served upon the record owner and
posted on the property; and one copy thereof shall be served on each of the
following if known to the building official or disclosed from official public
records: the holder of any mortgage or deed of trust or other lien or
encumbrance of record; the owner or holder of any lease of record; and the

Ordinance No.
Page 13 of 44



holder of any other estate or legal interest of record in or to the building or the
land on which it is located. The failure of the building official to serve any
person required herein to be served shall not invalidate any proceedings
hereunder as to any other person duly served or relieve any such person from
any duty or obligation imposed by the provisions of this section.

115.9.4 Method of Service. Service of the notice and order shall be made upon
all persons entitled thereto either personally or by mailing a copy of such notice
and order by certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt requested, to each
such person at their address as it appears on the last equalized assessment roll of
the county or as known to the building official. If no address of any such person
so appears or is known to the building official, then a copy of the notice and
order shall be so mailed, addressed to such person, at the address of the building
involved in the proceedings. The failure of any such person to receive such
notice shall not affect the validity of any proceedings taken under this section.
Service by certified mail in the manner herein provided shall be effective on the
date of mailing.

115.9.4.1 Proof of Service. Proof of service of the notice and order
shall be certified to at the time of service by a written declaration under
penalty of perjury executed by the persons effecting service, declaring
the time, date and manner in which service was made. The declaration,
together with any receipt card returned in acknowledgement of receipt
by certified mail shall be affixed to the copy of the notice and order
retained by the building official.

Section 115.9.5 — Recordation of Notice and Order
If compliance is not had with the order within the time specified therein, and no
appeal has been properly and timely filed, the building official shall file in the
office of the county recorder a certificate describing the property and certifying
(i) that the building is a dangerous building and (ii) that the owner has been so
notified. Whenever the corrections ordered shall thereafter have been completed
or the building demolished so that it no longer exists as a dangerous building on
the property described in the certificate, the building official shall file a new
certificate with the county recorder certifying that the building has been
demolished or all required conditions have been made so that the building is no
longer dangerous, whichever is appropriate.

Section 115.9.6 — Repair, Vacation and Demolition
The following standards shall be followed by the building official (and by the
board of appeals if an appeal is taken) in ordering the repair, vacation or
demolition of any dangerous building or structure:

1. Any building declared a dangerous building under this code shall
be made to comply with one of the following:

Ordinance No.
Page 14 of 44



1.1 The building shall be repaired in accordance with
the current building code or other current code
applicable to the type of substandard conditions
requiring repair; or

1.2 The building shall be demolished at the option of
the building owner; or

1.3 If the building does not constitute an immediate
danger to the life, limb, property, or safety of the
public it may be vacated, secured and maintained
against entry.

2. If the building or structure is in such condition as to make it
immediately dangerous to the life, limb, property or safety of the
public or its occupants, it shall be ordered to be vacated.

Section 115.9.7- Notice to Vacate

115.9.7.1 Posting. Every notice to vacate shall, in addition to being served as
provided in Section 115.8.3, be posted at or upon each exit of the building and
shall be in substantially the following form:

DO NOT ENTER
UNSAFE TO OCCUPY
It is a misdemeanor to occupy this building or to
remove or deface this notice.
Building Official
City of Cotati

Chapter 5 General Height and Areas is amended as follows:

Section 501.2 shall read as follows: Approved address numbers shall be
provided for all new building in such a position as to be plainly visible and
legible from the street fronting the property or as approved by the Building
Official or Fire Chief. Approved address shall be lighted, either internally or
externally to ensure plain visibility. These numbers shall contrast with their
background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabetical letters.
Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum
stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).

Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems

Section 903.2. is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 15 of 44



903.2 Where Required. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed and
maintained in all newly constructed buildings.

Exceptions:

1. Detached Group U occupancies 1000 sq. ft. or less. Agricultural
buildings and private riding arenas as approved by the Fire Code
Official.

2. Detached pool houses up to 1000 sqg. ft. in floor area within 50 feet
of the pool and limited to a single bathroom.

3. A room above a detached garage used for storage only that does not
contain a bathroom, cooking or refrigeration facilities or connections
for such facilities.

4. Detached non-combustible motor vehicle fuel dispensing canopies
classified as a Group M occupancy.

5. Car Ports of non-combustible construction.

6. B or M occupancies 500 sg. ft or less.

Section 903.2.1 is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:
903.2.1 Additions. Additions to existing commercial buildings that increase square feet

(based on the following percentages) calculated by the existing gross floor area shall
meet the requirements for a newly constructed building:

<=640 sq ft: 200%
641-1000 sq ft: 150%
1001-4000 sq ft: 100%
>=4001 sq ft 50%

Sections 903.2.1.1 through 903.2.1.5 are hereby deleted.

Section 903.2.2. is hereby deleted and replaced to read as follows:

903.2.2 Alteration or Repairs. For alterations or repairs to existing building(s)
involving demolition, removal, or repair due to fire damage of more than 50% of the
structure, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building.

Exceptions:
1. One time alterations or additions made solely for the
purpose of complying with the Americans with Disabilities
Act.

Changes of Occupancy. For any change of occupancy when the proposed new
occupancy classification is more hazardous based on life and fire risk, as determined by
the Fire Code Official, including the conversion of residential buildings to

Ordinance No.
Page 16 of 44



condominiums, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed
building.

Chapter 34 Existing Structures is amended as follows:

Section 3402 For the purposes of this chapter, the following definition applies and is
hereby added to Section 3402.1 Definitions of the 2007 California Building Code
(CBC):

Substantial Structural Damage. A condition where:

1. In any story, the vertical elements of the lateral-force-resisting system, have
suffered damage such that the lateral load-carrying capacity of the structure in
any direction has been reduced by more than 20 percent from its pre-damaged
condition, or

2. The capacity of any vertical gravity load-carrying component, or any group
of such components, that supports more than 30 percent of the total area of the
structure’s floor(s) and roof(s) has been reduced more than 20 percent from its
pre-damaged condition, and the remaining capacity of such affected elements with
respect to all dead and live loads is less than 75 percent of that required by
the building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

Section 3403 Alterations, Additions or Repairs, shall read as follows:

For the purposes of this chapter, the following repair requirements are hereby added as a
new Subsection 3403.5 to Section 3403 Additions, Alterations or Repair in the 2007
California Building Code (CBC):

3403.5.1 Repairs. Repairs of structural elements shall comply with this section.

3403.5.1.1 Seismic evaluation and design. Seismic evaluation and design of an
existing building and its components shall be based on the following criteria.

3403.5.1.1.1 Evaluation and design procedures. The seismic evaluation and
design shall be based on the procedures specified in the building code, ASCE 31 Seismic
Evaluation of Existing Buildings (for evaluation only) or ASCE 41 Seismic Rehabilitation
of Existing Buildings. The procedures contained in Appendix A of the International
Existing Building Code shall be permitted to be used as specified in Section
3403.5.1.1.3.

3403.5.1.1.2 CBC level seismic forces. When seismic forces are required to meet the
building code level, they shall be one of the following:

1. 100 percent of the values in the building code. The R factor used for analysis in
accordance with Chapter 16 of the building code shall be the R factor specified

Ordinance No.
Page 17 of 44



for structural systems classified as “Ordinary” unless it can be demonstrated
that the structural system satisfies the proportioning and detailing requirements
for systems classified as “Intermediate” or “Special”.

2. Forces corresponding to BSE-1 and BSE-2 Earthquake Hazard Levels defined
in ASCE 41. Where ASCE 41 is used, the corresponding performance levels
shall be those shown in Table 3403.5.1.1.2.

TABLE 3403.5.1.1.2
ASCE 41 and ASCE 31 PERFORMANCE LEVELS
PERFORMANCE LEVEL PERFORMANCE LEVEL
OCCUPANCY FOR USE WITH ASCE 31 FOR
CATEGORY AND WITH ASCE 41 USE WITH ASCE 41 BSE-2
(BASED ON IBC BSE-1 EARTHQUAKE EARTHQUAKE HAZARD
TABLE 1604.5) HAZARD LEVEL LEVEL
Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)
Life Safety (LS) Collapse Prevention (CP)
Note (a) Note (a)
Immediate Occupancy (10) Life Safety (LS)

a.

Performance Levels for Occupancy Category Il shall be taken as halfway
between the performance levels specified for Occupancy Category Il and
Occupancy Category IV

3403.5.1.1.3 Reduced CBC level seismic forces. When seismic forces are
permitted to meet reduced building code levels, they shall be one of the following:

1.

75 percent of the forces prescribed in the building code. The R factor used for
analysis in accordance with Chapter 16 of the building code shall be the R
factor as specified in Section 3403.5.1.1.2.

In accordance with the applicable chapters in Appendix A of the International
Existing Building Code as specified in Items 2.1 through 2.5 below. Structures
or portions of structures that comply with the requirements of the applicable
chapter in Appendix A shall be deemed to comply with the requirements for
reduced building code force levels.

2.1.  The seismic evaluation and design of unreinforced masonry bearing wall
buildings in Occupancy Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter Al.

2.2.  Seismic evaluation and design of the wall anchorage system in
reinforced concrete and reinforced masonry wall buildings with flexible

Ordinance No.
Page 18 of 44



diaphragms in Occupancy Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter A2.

2.3.  Seismic evaluation and design of cripple walls and sill plate anchorage
in residential buildings of light-frame wood construction in
Occupancy Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter A3.

2.4.  Seismic evaluation and design of soft, weak, or open-front wall
conditions in multiunit residential buildings of wood construction
in Occupancy Category | or Il are permitted to be based on the
procedures specified in Appendix Chapter A4.

2.5.  Seismic evaluation and design of concrete buildings and concrete with
masonry infill buildings in all Occupancy Categories are permitted
to be based on the procedures specified in Appendix Chapter Ab.

3. In accordance with ASCE 31 based on the applicable performance level as
shown in Table 3403.5.1.1.2

4. Those associated with the BSE-1 Earthquake Hazard Level defined in ASCE 41
and the performance level as shown in Table 3403.5.1.1.2. Where ASCE 41 is
used, the design spectral response acceleration parameters sy ™ Sx shall
not be taken less than 75 percent of the respective design spectral response
acceleration parameters sps " So1 defined by the International Building
Code and its reference standards.

3403.5.1.2 Wind Design. Wind design of existing buildings shall be based on the
procedures specified in the building code.

3403.5.2 Repairs to damaged buildings. Repairs to damaged buildings shall comply
with this section.

3403.5.2.1 Unsafe conditions. Regardless of the extent of structural damage, unsafe
conditions shall be eliminated.

3403.5.2.2 Substantial structural damage to vertical elements of the lateral-
force-resisting system. A building that has sustained substantial structural damage to
the vertical elements of its lateral-force-resisting system shall be evaluated and repaired
in accordance with the applicable provisions of Section 3403.5.2.2.1 through 3403.5.2.2.3.

3403.5.2.2.1 Evaluation. The building shall be evaluated by a registered design
professional, and the evaluation findings shall be submitted to the code official. The
evaluation shall establish whether the damaged building, if repaired to its pre-damage
state, would comply with the provisions of the building code. Wind forces for this
evaluation shall be those prescribed in the building code. Seismic forces for this

Ordinance No.
Page 19 of 44



evaluation are permitted to be the reduced level seismic forces specified in Code
Section 3403.5.1.1.3.

3403.5.2.2.2 Extent of repair for compliant buildings. If the evaluation
establishes compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with Section
3403.5.2.2.1, then repairs shall be permitted that restore the building to its pre-damage
state, using materials and strengths that existed prior to the damage.

3403.5.2.2.3 Extent of repair for non-compliant buildings. If the evaluation does
not establish compliance of the pre-damage building in accordance with Section
3403.5.2.2.1, then the building shall be rehabilitated to comply with applicable
provisions of the building code for load combinations including wind or seismic
forces. The wind design level for the repair shall be as required by the building code
in effect at the time of original construction unless the damage was caused by wind, in
which case the design level shall be as required by the code in effect at the time of
original construction or as required by the building code, whichever is greater. Seismic
forces for this rehabilitation design shall be those required for the design of the
predamaged building, but not less than the reduced level seismic forces specified in
Section 3403.5.1.1.3. New structural member and connections required by this
rehabilitation design shall comply with the detailing provisions of the building code
for new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

3403.5.2.3 Substantial structural damage to vertical load-carrying components.
Vertical load-carrying components that have sustained substantial structural damage
shall be rehabilitated to comply with the applicable provisions for dead and live loads
in the building code. Undamaged vertical load-carrying components that receive dead
or live loads from rehabilitated components shall also be rehabilitated to carry the
design loads of the rehabilitation design. New structural members and connections
required by this rehabilitation design shall comply with the detailing provisions of the
building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose, and location.

3403.5.2.3.1 Lateral force-resisting elements. Regardless of the level of damage to
vertical elements of the lateral force-resisting system, if substantial structural damage
to vertical load-carrying components was caused primarily by wind or seismic effects,
then the building shall be evaluated in accordance with Section 3403.5.2.2.1 and, if
non-compliant, rehabilitated in accordance with Section 3403.5.2.2.3.

3403.5.2.4 Less than substantial structural damage. For damage less than
substantial structural damage, repairs shall be allowed that restore the building to its
pre-damage state, using materials and strengths that existed prior to the damage. New
structural members and connections used for this repair shall comply with the detailing
provisions of the building code for new buildings of similar structure, purpose,
and location.

3403.5.3 Referenced Standards

Ordinance No.
Page 20 of 44



Standard Referenced References: In Code Number, Title, Section and Number

ASCE 31-03 Seismic Evaluation of Existing Buildings 3403.5.1.1.1, TABLE
3403.5.1.1.2, 3403.5.1.1.3

ASCE 41-06 Seismic Rehabilitation of Existing Buildings 3403.5.1.1.1,
3403.5.1.1.2, TABLE 3403.5.1.1.2, 3403.5.1.1.3

14.04.050 The California Electric Code

The 2007 Edition of the California Electric Code and appendices as published by the National Fire
Protection Association, incorporating by adoption of the 2005 Edition of the National Electric Code is
adopted by reference with California Amendments adopted by reference and is amended as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

14.04.060 The California Mechanical Code

The 2007 Edition of the California Mechanical Code and appendices as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, incorporating by adoption of the
2006 Edition of the Uniform Mechanical Code with California Amendments is adopted by reference
including Appendix Chapter 1, Chapters A, B, C and D and is amended to read as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.
14.04.070 The California Plumbing Code

The 2007 Edition of the California Plumbing Code and appendices as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, incorporating by adoption of the
2006 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code with California Amendments is adopted by reference
including Appendix Chapter 1, Chapters A, B, D, G, I, and K and is amended to read as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

14.04.080 2007 Edition of the California Energy Code

2007 Edition of the California Energy Code as published by the California Building Standards
Commission and is adopted by reference.

14.04.090 The California Fire Code
The 2007 Edition of the California Fire Code as published by the International Code Council

incorporating by adoption of the 2006 Edition of the International Fire Code of the International Code
Council is adopted with California Amendments, and adopted by reference including all amendments

Ordinance No.
Page 21 of 44



incorporated in this adoption, Appendix Chapter 1, Appendix Chapters B, C, and D with the following
amendments and is adopted by reference.

California Fire Code
CHAPTER 5 FIRE SERVICE FEATURES is amended to read as follows:
SECTION 501 GENERAL

501.1 Scope. Fire service for buildings, structures and premises shall comply
with this chapter.

501.2 Permits. A permit shall be required as set fourth in Sections 105.6 and
105.7.

501.3 Construction documents. Construction documents for proposed fire
apparatus access, location of fire lanes and construction documents and
hydraulic calculations for fire hydrant systems shall be submitted to the fire
department for review and approval prior to construction.

501.4 Timing of installation. When fire apparatus access roads or a water
supply for fire protection is required to be installed, such protection shall be
installed and made serviceable prior to and during the time of construction.
Temporary street signs shall be installed at each street intersection when
construction of new roadways allows passage by vehicles in accordance with
Section 505.2.

SECTION 502 DEFINITIONS

502.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this
chapter and as used elsewhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD. A road that provides fire
apparatus access from a fire station to a facility, building or portion
thereof. This is a general term inclusive of all other terms such as fire
lane, public street, private street, parking lot, lane and access roadway.

FIRE COMMAND CENTER. The principal attended or unattended
location where the status of the detection, alarm communications and
control systems is displayed, and from which the system(s) can be
manually controlled.

FIRE DEPARTMENT MASTER KEY. A limited issue key of special
or controlled design to be carried by fire department officials in
command which will open key boxes on specified properties.

Ordinance No.
Page 22 of 44



FIRE LANE. A road or other passageway developed to allow the
passage of fire apparatus. A fire lane is not necessarily intended for
vehicular traffic other than fire apparatus.

KEY BOX. A secure device with a lock operable only by a fire
department master key, and containing building entry keys and other
keys that may be required for access in an emergency.

SECTION 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and
maintained in accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3.

503.1.1 Buildings and facilities. Approved fire apparatus access roads shall be
provided for every facility, building or portion of a building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction. The fire apparatus access
road shall comply with the requirements of this section and shall extend to
within 150 feet (45720 mm) of all portions of the facility and all portions of the
exterior walls of the first story of the building as measured by an approved route
around the exterior of the building or facility.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to increase the dimension
of 150 feet (45720 mm) where:

1. The building is equipped throughout with an
approved automatic sprinkler system installed in
accordance with Section 903.2.1.1, 903.3.1.2 or
903.3.1.3. (change numbers to adopted code county
ordnance)

2. Fire apparatus access roads cannot be installed
because of location on property, topography,
waterways, nonnegotiable grades or other similar
conditions, and an approved alternative means of
fire protection is provided.

3. There are not more than two Group R-3 or Group U
occupancies.

503.1.2 Additional access. The fire code official is authorized to require more
than one fire apparatus access road based on the potential for impairment of a
single road by vehicle congestion, condition of terrain, climatic conditions or
other factors that could limit access.

Ordinance No.
Page 23 of 44



503.1.3 High-piled storage. Fire department vehicle access to buildings used for
high-piled combustible storage shall comply with the applicable provisions of
Chapter 23.

503.2 Specifications. Fire apparatus access roads shall be installed and arranged
in accordance with Sections 503.2.1 through 503.2.7.

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed
width of not less than 20 feet (6047 mm), except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less
than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm).

503.2.2 Authority. The fire code official shall have the authority to require an
increase in the minimum access widths where they are inadequate for fire or
rescue operations.

503.2.3 Surface. Fire apparatus access roads shall be designed and maintained to
support the imposed loads of fire apparatus and shall be surfaced so as to provide
all-weather driving capabilities.

503.2.4 Turning radius. The required turning radius of a fire apparatus access
road shall be determined by the fire code official.

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of 150 feet
(45720 mm) in length shall be provided with an approved area for turning
around fire apparatus.

503.2.6 Bridges and elevated surfaces. Where a bridge or an elevated surface is
part of a fire apparatus access road, the bridge shall be constructed and
maintained in accordance with AASHTO Standard Specifications. Bridges and
elevated surfaces shall be designed for a live load sufficient to carry the imposed
loads of fire apparatus. Vehicle load limits shall be posted at both entrances to
bridges when required by the fire code official. Where elevated surfaces
designed for emergency vehicle use are adjacent to surfaces which are not
designed for such use, approved barriers, approved signs or both shall be
installed and maintained when required by the fire code official.

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of the fire apparatus access road shall be within the
limits established by the fire code official based on the fire department's
apparatus.

503.3 Marking. Where required by the fire code official, approved signs or
other approved notices shall be provided for fire apparatus access roads to
identify such roads or prohibit the obstruction thereof. Signs or notices shall be
maintained in a clean and legible condition at all times and be replaced or
repaired when necessary to provide adequate visibility.

Ordinance No.
Page 24 of 44



503.4 Obstruction of fire apparatus access roads. Fire apparatus access roads
shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of vehicles. The
minimum widths and clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall be
maintained at all times.

Section 503.5 is deleted.

503.5.1 Secured gates and barricades. When required, gates and barricades
shall be secured in an approved manner. Roads, trails and other access ways that
have been closed and obstructed in the manner prescribed by Section 503.5 shall
not be trespassed on or used unless authorized by the owner and the fire code
official.

Exception: The restriction on use shall not apply to public officers acting
within the scope of duty.

503.6 Security gates. The installation of security gates across a fire apparatus
access road shall be approved by the fire chief. Where security gates are
installed, they shall have an approved means of emergency operation. The
security gates and the emergency operation shall be maintained operational at all
times.

SECTION 504 ACCESS TO BUILDING OPENINGS AND ROOFS

504.1 Required access. Exterior doors and openings required by this code or the
International Building Code shall be maintained readily accessible for
emergency access by the fire department. An approved access walkway leading
from fire apparatus access roads to exterior openings shall be provided when
required by the fire code official.

504.2 Maintenance of exterior doors and openings. Exterior doors and their
function shall not be eliminated without prior approval. Exterior doors that have
been rendered nonfunctional and that retain a functional door exterior
appearance shall have a sign affixed to the exterior side of the door with the
words THIS DOOR BLOCKED. The sign shall consist of letters having a
principal stroke of not less than 0.75 inch (19.1 mm) wide and at least 6 inches
(152 mm) high on a contrasting background. Required fire department access
doors shall not be obstructed or eliminated. Exit and exit access doors shall
comply with Chapter 10. Access doors for high-piled combustible storage shall
comply with Section 2306.6.1.

504.3 Stairway access to roof. New buildings four or more stories in height,
except those with a roof slope greater than four units vertical in 12 units
horizontal (33.3 percent slope), shall be provided with a stairway to the roof.
Stairway access to the roof shall be in accordance with Section 1009.12. Such

Ordinance No.
Page 25 of 44



stairway shall be marked at street and floor levels with a sign indicating that the
stairway continues to the roof. Where roofs are used for roof gardens or for
other purposes, stairways shall be provided as required for such occupancy
classification.

SECTION 505 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION

505.1 Address numbers. New and existing buildings shall have approved
illuminated address numbers, building numbers or approved building
identification placed in a position that is plainly legible and visible from the
street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall contrast with their
background. Address numbers shall be Arabic numerals or alphabet letters.
Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (102 mm) high with a minimum stroke
width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm).

Exception: Rural residential as approved by the fire code official.

505.2 Street or road signs. Streets and roads shall be identified with approved
signs. Temporary signs shall be installed at each street intersection when
construction of new roadways allows passage by vehicles. Signs shall be of an
approved size, weather resistant and be maintained until replaced by permanent
signs.

SECTION 506 KEY BOXES

506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is
restricted because of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary
for life-saving or fire-fighting purposes, the fire code official is authorized to
require a key box to be installed in an approved location. The key box shall be of
an approved type and shall contain keys to gain necessary access as required by
the fire code official.

506.1.1 Locks. An approved lock shall be installed on gates or similar barriers
when required by the fire code official.

506.2 Key box maintenance. The operator of the building shall immediately
notify the fire code official and provide the new key when a lock is changed or
re-keyed. The key to such lock shall be secured in the key box.

SECTION 507 HAZARDS TO FIRE FIGHTERS
507.1 Trapdoors to be closed. Trapdoors and scuttle covers, other than those

that are within a dwelling unit or automatically operated, shall be kept closed at
all times except when in use.

Ordinance No.
Page 26 of 44



507.2 Shaftway markings. Vertical shafts shall be identified as required by this
section.

507.2.1 Exterior access to shaftways. Outside openings accessible to the fire
department and which open directly on a hoistway or shaftway communicating
between two or more floors in a building shall be plainly marked with the word
SHAFTWAY in red letters at least 6 inches (152 mm) high on a white
background. Such warning signs shall be placed so as to be readily discernible
from the outside of the building.

507.2.2 Interior access to shaftways. Door or window openings to a hoistway
or shaftway from the interior of the building shall be plainly marked with the
word SHAFTWAY in red letters at least 6 inches (152 mm) high on a white
background. Such warning signs shall be placed so as to be readily discernible.

Exception: Marking shall not be required on shaftway openings which
are readily discernible as openings onto a shaftway by the construction or
arrangement.

507.3 Pitfalls. The intentional design or alteration of buildings to disable, injure,
maim or kill intruders is prohibited. No person shall install and use firearms,
sharp or pointed objects, razor wire, explosives, flammable or combustible liquid
containers, or dispensers containing highly toxic, toxic, irritant or other
hazardous materials in a manner which may passively or actively disable, injure,
maim or Kill a fire fighter who forcibly enters a building for the purpose of
controlling or extinguishing a fire, rescuing trapped occupants or rendering other
emergency assistance.

SECTION 508 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES

508.1 Required water supply. An approved water supply capable of supplying
the required fire flow for fire protection shall be provided to premises upon
which facilities, buildings or portions of buildings are hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction.

508.2 Type of water supply. A water supply shall consist of reservoirs, pressure
tanks, elevated tanks, water mains or other fixed systems capable of providing
the required fire flow.

508.2.1 Private fire service mains. Private fire service: mains and
appurtenances shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 24 (National Fire
Protection Association).

508.2.2 Water tanks. Water tanks for private fire protection shall be installed in
accordance with NFPA 22.

Ordinance No.
Page 27 of 44



508.3 Fire flow. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings
and facilities shall be determined by an approved method.

508.4 Water supply test. The fire code official shall be notified prior to the
water supply test. Water supply tests shall be witnessed by the fire code official
or approved documentation of the test shall be provided to the fire code official
prior to final approval of the water supply system.

508.5 Fire hydrant systems. Fire hydrant systems shall comply with Sections
508.5.1 through 508.5.6.

508.5.1 Where required. Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter
constructed or moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than 150 feet
(45.179 m) from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by an
approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-site fire
hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the fire code official.

508.5.2 Inspection, testing and maintenance. Fire hydrant systems shall be
subject to periodic tests as required by the fire code official. Fire hydrant
systems shall be maintained in an operative condition at all times and shall be
repaired where defective. Additions, repairs, alterations and servicing shall
comply with approved standards.

508.5.3 Private fire service mains and water tanks. Private fire service mains
and water tanks shall be periodically inspected, tested and maintained in
accordance with NFPA 25 at the following intervals:

1. Private fire hydrants (all types): Inspection annually and after
each operation; flow test and maintenance annually.

2. Fire service main piping: Inspection of exposed, annually; fow
test every 5 years.

3. Fire service main piping strainers: Inspection and  maintenance
after each use.

508.5.4 Obstruction. Posts, fences, vehicles, growth, trash, storage and other
materials or objects shall not be placed or kept near fire hydrants, fire
department inlet connections or fire protection system control valves in a manner
that would prevent such equipment or fire hydrants from being immediately
discernible. The fire department shall not be deterred or hindered from gaining
immediate access to fire protection equipment or fire hydrants.

508.5.5 Clear space around hydrants. A 3-foot (914 mm) clear space shall be
maintained around the circumference of fire hydrants except as otherwise
required or approved.

Ordinance No.
Page 28 of 44



508.5.6 Physical protection. Where fire hydrants are subject to impact by a
motor vehicle, guard posts or other approved means shall comply with Section
312.

SECTION 509 FIRE COMMAND CENTER

509.1 Features. Where required by other sections of this code and in all
buildings classified as high-rise buildings by the International Building Code, a
fire command center for fire department operations shall be provided. The
location and accessibility of the fire command center shall be approved by the
fire department. The fire command center shall be separated from the remainder
of the building by not less than a 1- hour fire barrier constructed in accordance
with Section 706 of the International Building Code or horizontal assembly
constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the International Building Code,
or both. The room shall be a minimum of 96 square feet (9 m2) with a minimum
dimension of 8 feet (2438 mm). A layout of the fire command center and all
features required by this section to be contained therein shall be submitted for
approval prior to installation. The fire command center shall comply with NFPA
72 and shall contain the following features:

1. The emergency voice/alarm communication
system unit.
2. The fire department communications system.
3. Fire-detection and alarm system annunciator system.
4. Annunciator visually indicating the location of the elevators and

whether they are operational.

5. Status indicators, and controls for air-handling
systems.
6. The fire-fighter’s control panel required by Section 909.16 for
smoke control systems installed in the building.
7. Controls for unlocking stairway doors simultaneously.
8. Sprinkler valve and water-flow detector display panels.
9. Emergency and standby power status indicators.

10. A telephone for fire department use with controlled
access to the public telephone system.

Ordinance No.
Page 29 of 44



11.

12.

13.

14.

15.

Fire pump status indicators.

Schematic building plans indicating the typical floor plan and
detailing the building core, means of egress, fire protection
systems, fire-fighting equipment and fire department access.
Work table.

Generator supervision devices, manual start and transfer features.

Public address system, where specifically required by
other sections of this code.

SECTION 510

FIRE DEPARTMENT ACCESS TO EQUIPMENT

510.1 Identification. Fire protection equipment shall be identified in an
approved manner. Rooms containing controls for air-conditioning systems,
sprinkler risers and valves, or other fire detection, suppression or control
elements shall be identified for the use of the fire department. Approved signs
required to identify fire protection equipment and equipment location, shall be
constructed of durable materials, permanently installed and readily visible.

SECTION 903
Automatic Sprinkler Systems

Section 903.2 Where Required. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed and
maintained in all newly constructed buildings.

Exceptions:

1. Detached Group U occupancies 1000 sq. ft. or less. Agricultural
buildings and private riding arenas as approved by the Fire Code
Official.

2. Detached pool houses up to 1000 sqg. ft. in floor area within 50 feet
of the pool and limited to a single bathroom.

3. A room above a detached garage used for storage only that does not
contain a bathroom, cooking or refrigeration facilities or connections
for such facilities.

4. Detached non-combustible motor vehicle fuel dispensing canopies
classified as a Group M occupancy.

5. Car Ports of non-combustible construction.

Ordinance No.
Page 30 of 44



6. B or M occupancies 500 sqg. ft or less.

Section 903.2.1 Additions. Additions to existing commercial and residential buildings
that increase square feet (based on the following percentages) calculated by the existing
gross floor area shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building:

<=640 sq ft: 200%
641-1000 sq ft: 150%
1001-4000 sq ft: 100%
>=4001 sq ft 50%

903.2.2 Alteration or Repairs. For alterations or repairs to existing building(s)

involving demolition, removal, or repair due to fire damage of more than 50% of the

structure, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed building.
Exceptions:

1. One time alterations or additions made solely for the
purpose of complying with the Americans with Disabilities Act.

903.2.3 Changes of Occupancy. Any change of occupancy when the proposed new
occupancy classification is more hazardous based on life and fire risk, as determined by
the Fire Code Official, including the conversion of residential buildings to
condominiums, the building shall meet the requirements for a newly constructed
building.

Subsections 903.2.4 through 903.2.13 are deleted.

903.3 Installation Requirements. Sprinkler systems shall be installed in accordance
with NFPA 13, NFPA 13R if approved by the Fire Code Official and NFPA 13D.

Subsections 903.3.1 through 903.3.7 are deleted.

903.4 Sprinkler System Monitoring and Alarms. Except for Group R, Division 3
Occupancies, all valves controlling the water supply for automatic sprinkler systems,
pumps, tanks, water levels, water flow switches shall be electronically supervised.
Valves when used for standpipes are excluded from this provision unless required by
the Fire Code Official.

903.4.1 Signals. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and
shall be automatically transmitted to an approved central station, remote supervising
station or propriety supervising station as defined in NFPA 72, or when approved by
the Fire Code Official, shall sound an audible alarm at a constantly attended location.

Ordinance No.
Page 31 of 44



903.4.2 Alarms. Every new fire alarm system installed for the purpose of evacuation,
including those systems activated solely by fire sprinkler systems shall be designed so
that all occupants of the building shall be notified audibly and visually
903.4.2.1 Each separate Occupancy; or
903.4.2.2 Each separate residential dwelling unit
Subsection 903.4.3 through 903.6.1 are deleted.

Section 905
Section 905 is amended to read as follows:
905.3.1 Building height. Class | standpipes shall be installed in buildings three stories
or over in height with approved outlets provided on each floor level, including the roof
when roof access is provided.
Subsection 905.3.2, 905.3.3, and 905.4.6 are deleted.
Subsection 905.9 exception 2 is deleted.
Subsection 907.2.8.3 all wording after “as required by section 907.2.10.” is deleted.

Subsection 907.2.8.1 Exception 2 is amended to read as follows:

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required throughout the
building when the following conditions are met.

2.1  The building is equipped throughout with an automatic fire
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 0r 903.3.1.2 and

2.2 Within each residential unit the notification devices will
activate upon sprinkler water flow and

2.3 At least one manual fire alarm box is installed in an
approved location.

Subsection 907.2.9 Exception 2 is amended to read as follows:

2. Manual fire alarm boxes are not required throughout the
building when the following conditions are met.

Ordinance No.
Page 32 of 44



2.1 The building is equipped throughout with an automatic fire
sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section
903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 and

2.2  Within each residential unit the notification devices will
activate upon sprinkler water flow and

2.3 Atleast one manual fire alarm box is installed in an approved
location.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 101.1 Shall be revised to read: These regulations
shall be known as the Fire Code of the City of Cotati, hereinafter referred to as
“this code”.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 109 Violations

Section 109.3.2 Citations. The Chief is authorized to issue a citation to persons
operating or maintaining an occupancy, premise, or vehicle subject to this code,
who allows a hazard to exist or fail to take immediate action to abate a hazard
on such occupancy, premises, or vehicle when ordered or notified to do so.

Section 2. DEFINITIONS.

California Fire Code Section 202 Wherever the word “jurisdiction” is used in
the 2007 California Fire Code and 2006 International Fire Code, it shall be
understood to mean that the Rancho Adobe Fire District is the local fire
authority having jurisdiction.

California Fire Code Section 202 Where the party responsible for the
enforcement of the 2007 California Fire Code and 2006 International Fire Code

is given the title of “fire marshal,” add the following definition:

FIRE MARSHAL is the chief of the bureau of fire prevention of
Rancho Adobe Fire Prevention District.

APPENDIX B FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

SECTION B101
GENERAL

Section B101 is amended to read as follows:

B101.1 Scope. The procedure for determining fire-flow

Ordinance No.
Page 33 of 44



requirements for buildings or portions of buildings hereafter constructed
shall be in accordance with this appendix. This appendix does not apply
to structures other than buildings.

SECTION B102
DEFINITIONS

B102.I Definitions. For the purpose of this appendix, certain terms are
defined as follows:

FIRE-FLOW. The flow rate of a water supply, measured at 20
pounds per square inch (psi) (138 kPa) residual pressure, that is
available for fire fighting.

FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA. The floor area, in
square feet (m2), used to determine the required fire flow.

SECTION B103
MODIFICATIONS

Section B103 is amended to read as follows:

BI03.I Decreases. The fire chief is authorized to reduce the fire-flow
requirements for isolated buildings or a group of buildings in rural areas
or small communities where the development of full fire-flow
requirements is impractical.

BI03.2 Increases. The fire code official is authorized to increase the fire-
flow requirements where conditions indicate an unusual susceptibility to
group fires or conflagrations.

B103.3 Areas without water supply systems. For information regarding
water supplies for fire-fighting purposes in rural and suburban areas in
which adequate and reliable water supply systems do not exist, the fire
code official is authorized to utilize NFPA 1142 or the International
Wildland-Urban Interface Code.

SECTION B104
FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA

Section B104 is amended to read as follows:

BI04.1 General. The fire-flow calculation area shall be the total floor
area of all floor levels within the exterior walls, and under the horizontal
projections of the roof of a building, except as modified in Section
B104.3.

Ordinance No.
Page 34 of 44



SECTION B106

ICC IBC
ICC IWUIC
NFPA 1142

Bl04.2 Area separation. Portions of buildings which are separated by
fire walls without openings, constructed in accordance with the
International Building Code, are allowed to be considered as separate
fire-flow calculation areas.

Bl104.3 Type IA and Type IB construction. The fire-flow calculation
area of buildings constructed of Type IA and Type IB construction shall
be the area of the three largest successive floors.

Exception: Fire-flow calculation area for open parking garages
shall be determined by the area of the largest floor.

SECTION B105
FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS

Section B105 is amended to read as follows:

BI05.1 One- and two-family dwellings. The minimum fire-flow
requirements for one- and two-family dwellings having a fire-flow
calculation area which does not exceed 3,600 square feet (344.5 m2)
shall be 1500 gallons per minute (3785.4 L/min). Fire-flow and flow
duration for dwellings having a fire-flow calculation area in excess of
3,600 square feet (344.5 m2) shall not be less than that specified in Table
B 105.1.

B105.2 Buildings other than one- and two-family dwellings. The
minimum fire-flow and flow duration for buildings other than one- and
two-family dwellings shall be as specified in Table B105.1.

Exception: A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50 percent,
as approved, is allowed when the building is provided with an
approved automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. The resulting fire-flow shall not
be less than 1,500 gallons per minute (5678 L/min) for the
prescribed duration as specified in Table B105.1.

REFERENCED STANDARDS

International Building Code B104.2, Table B105.1
International Wildland Urban Interface Code B103.3
Standard on Water Supplies for B103.3

Suburban and Rural Fire Fighting

Ordinance No.
Page 35 of 44



APPENDIX B

TABLE B105.1

MINIMUM REQUIRED FIRE-FLOW AND FLOW DURATION FOR
BUILDINGS:

FIRE-FLOW CALCULATION AREA (square feet)

FIRE-FLOW
(gallons per minute)

minmminutesMmMMIN

FLOW DURATION

Type IA and 1B Type I1A and 111A° Type IV and V-A” Type 11B and 111B° Type V-B° (hours)
0-22,700 0-12,700 0-8,200 0-5,900 0-3,600 1,500
22,701-30,200 | 12,701-17,000 8,201-10,900 5,901-7,900 3,601-4,800 1,750
30,201-38,700 | 17,001-21,800 | 10,901-12,900 7,901-9,800 4,801-6,200 2,000
38,701-48,300 | 21,801-24200 | 12,901-17,400 9,801-12,600 6,201-7,700 2,250 ?
4830159000 | 24,201-33200 | 17,401-21300 | 12,601-15,400 7,701-9,400 2,500
59,001-70,900 | 33201-39,700 | 21,301-25500 | 15401-18400 | 9,401-11,300 2,750
70,901-83700 | 39701-47,100 | 25501-30,100 | 18,401-21,800 | 11,301-13,400 3,000
83,701-97,700 | 47,101-54900 | 30,101-35200 | 21,801-25900 | 13.401-15,600 3,250
97,701-112,700 | 54901-63400 | 35201-40600 | 25,901-29300 | 15,601-18,000 3,500 ’
11122877%% 63401-72,400 | 40,601-46,400 | 29,301-33500 | 18,001-20,600 3,750
1131852%% 72,401-82,100 | 4640152500 | 33501-37,900 | 20,601-23,300 4,000
11‘;’55492%10 82,101-92,400 | 52501-59,100 | 37,001-42700 | 23,301-26,300 4,250
112‘;1%% 92,401-103,100 | 59,101-66,000 | 42,701-47,700 | 26,301-29,300 4,500
12%33‘;%% 103,101-114600 | 66,001-73300 | 47,701-53,000 | 29,301-32,600 4,750
22%3572%% 114601-126700 | 73301-81,100 | 53,00158,600 | 32,601-36,000 5,000
%i5727%10 126,701-139,400 | 81,101-89,200 | 58,601-65400 | 36,001-39,600 5,250
%_‘;7172%10 139,401-152,600 | 89,201-97,700 | 65401-70,600 | 39,601-43,400 5,500
227915%%% 152,601-166500 | 97,701-106,500 | 70,601-77,000 | 43,401-47,400 5,750
g 166,501-Greater | 106,501-115,800 | 77,001-83700 | 47,401-51500 6,000 4
— — 115801125500 | 83,701-90,600 | 51,501-55700 6,250
— — 125501135500 | 90,601-97,000 | 55701-60,200 6,500
- — 135501145800 | 97,901-106,800 | 60,201-64,800 6,750
— — 145801-156,700 | 106,801-113,200 | 64,801-69,600 7,000
— — 156,701-167,000 | 113,201-121,300 | 69,601-74,600 7,250
- - 167,001-179,400 | 121,301-129,600 | 74,601-79,800 7,500
— — 179,401-191,400 | 129,601-138,300 | 79,801-85,100 7,750
- - 191,40 I-Greater 138,301-Greater 85,101-Greater 8,000

For SI: 1 square foot =0.0929 m?, 1 gallon per minute =3.785 LIm, 1 pound per

square inch = 6.895kPa.
a. The minimum required fire flow shall be allowed to be reduced by 25 percent for

Ordinance No.

Page 36 of 44



Group R.

b. Types of construction are based on the California Building Code.

¢. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or similar fire
problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for transportation hazards.

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof.

2007 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE

APPENDIX C FIRE HYDRANT LOCATION AND
DISTRIBUTION

SECTION 101 GENERAL
Section C101 is amended to read as follows:

C101.1 Scope. Fire hydrants shall be provided in accordance with this
appendix for the protection of buildings, or portions of buildings,
hereafter constructed.

SECTION C102
LOCATION

Section C102 is amended to read as follows:

Cl02.1 Fire hydrant locations. Fire hydrants shall be provided along
required fire apparatus access roads and adjacent public streets.

SECTION C103
NUMBER OF FIRE HYDRANTS

Section C103 is amended to read as follows:

Cl03.I Fire hydrants available. The minimum number of fire hydrants
available to a building shall not be less than that listed in Table C105.1.
The number of fire hydrants available to a complex or subdivision shall
not be less than that determined by spacing requirements listed in Table
CI05.1 when applied to fire apparatus access roads and perimeter public
streets from which fire operations could be conducted.

SECTION C104
CONSIDERATION OF EXISTING FIRE HYDRANTS

Section C104 is amended to read as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 37 of 44



Cl04.1 Existing fire hydrants. Existing fire hydrants on public streets
are allowed to be considered as available. Existing fire hydrants on
adjacent properties shall not be considered available unless fire apparatus
access roads extend between properties and easements are established to
prevent obstruction of such roads.

SECTION C105
DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

Section C105 is amended to read as follows:

Cl05.1 Hydrant spacing. The average spacing between fire hydrants
shall not exceed that listed in Table C105.1.

Exception: The fire chief is authorized to accept a deficiency of
up to 10 percent where existing fire hydrants provide all or a
portion of the required fire hydrant service. Regardless of the
average spacing, fire hydrants shall be located such that all points
on streets and access roads adjacent to a building are within the
distance listed in Table C105.1.

Table C105.1 is amended to read as follows:

TABLE C105.1 NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE
HYDRANTS

TABLE C105.1
NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

FIRE-FLOW MINIMUM AVERAGE SPACING | MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM ANY

(gpm) OF HYDRANTS HYDRANTS®*® (feet) | STREET Oi ﬁggg;ﬁ?dNTAGE TO
1,750 or less 1 500 250
2,000-2,250 2 450 225
2,500 3 450 225
3,000 3 400 225
3,500-4,000 4 350 210
4,500-5,000 5 300 180
5,500 6 300 180
6,000 6 250 150
6,500-7,000 7 250 150
7,500 or more 8 or more® 200 120

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 LIm.

a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

b.Where streets are provided with median dividers which can be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or
where arterial streets are provided with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count of more than 30,000
vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an

Ordinance No.
Page 38 of 44




alternating tbasis up to a fire-flow requirement of 7,000 gallons per minute and 400 feet for higher fire-flow
requirements.

c. Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or
similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 feet to provide for
transportation hazards.

d.Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof

f. For commercial, industrial and multifamily residential average spacing shall be no greater then 300 feet.
g. Fire hydrants shall be located within 50 feet of the FDC, or as approved by the fire code official.

APPENDIX D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

SECTION D101
GENERAL

Section D101 is amended to read as follows:

D101.1 Scope. Fire apparatus access roads shall be in accordance with
this appendix as amended and all other applicable requirements of the
International Fire Code.

SECTION D102
REQUIRED ACCESS

Section D102 is amended to read as follows:

DI02.1 Access and loading. Facilities, buildings or portions of buildings
hereafter constructed shall be accessible to fire department apparatus by
way of an approved fire apparatus access road with an asphalt, concrete
or other approved driving surface capable of supporting the imposed load
of fire apparatus weighing at least 75,000 pounds (34050 kg) or as
approved by the code official.

SECTION D103
MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS

Section D103 is amended to read as follows:

DI03.2 Grade. Fire apparatus access roads shall not exceed 10 percent in
grade.

Exception: Grades steeper than 10 percent as approved by the
fire chief.

D103.3 Turning radius. The minimum turning radius shall be
determined by the fire code official.

D103.4 Dead ends. Dead-end fire apparatus access roads in excess of
150 feet (45720 mm) shall be provided with width and turnaround
provisions in accordance with Table D103.4.

Ordinance No.
Page 39 of 44



Table D103.4

REQUIREMENTS FOR DEAD-END FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROAD

LENGTH WIDTH (feet) TURNAROUNDS REQUIRED
(feet)
0-150 [20] Non required
151 - 500 [20] 120-foot Hammerhead, 60-foot “Y™ or 96-foot-diameter
cul-de-sac in accordance with Figure D 103.1
501 - 750 [26] 120-foot Hammerhead, 60-foot “Y™ or 96-foot-diameter
cul-de-sac in accordance with Figure D 103.1
Over 750 Special approval required

For Sl: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.

D103.5 Fire apparatus access road gates. Gates securing the fire
apparatus access roads shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. The minimum gate width shall be 20 feet (6096 mm).
2. Gates shall be of the swinging or sliding type.

3. Construction of gates shall be of materials that allow

manual operation by one person.
4. Gate components shall be maintained in an operative

condition at all times and replaced or repaired when

defective.
5. Electric gates shall be equipped with a means of opening  the
gate by fire department personnel for emergency  access. Emergency
opening devices shall be approved by the fire code official.
6. Manual opening gates shall not be locked with a padlock or

chain and padlock unless they are capable of being opened by
means of forcible entry tools or when a key box containing the key(s)
to the lock is installed at the gate location.
7. Locking device specifications shall be submitted for

approval by the fire code official.

DI03.6 Signs. Where required by the fire code official, fire apparatus
access roads shall be marked with permanent NO PARKING-FIRE
LANE signs complying C.V.C. (California Vehicle Code).

D103.6.1 Roads 20-26 feet in width. Fire apparatus access roads 20-26
feet wide (6096 to 7925 mm) shall be posted on both sides as a fire lane.

D103.6.2 Roads more than 26 feet in width. Fire apparatus access
roads more than 26 feet wide (7925 mm) to 32 feet wide (9754 mm) shall
be posted on one side of the road as a fire lane.

Ordinance No.
Page 40 of 44



SECTION D104
COMMERCIAL AND INDUSTRIAL DEVELOPMENTS

Section D104 is amended to read as follows:

D104.1 Buildings exceeding three stories or 30 feet in height.
Buildings or facilities exceeding 30 feet (9144 mm) or three stories in
height shall have at least three means of fire apparatus access for each
structure.

D104.2 Buildings exceeding 62,000 square feet in area. Buildings or
facilities having a gross building area of more than 62,000 square feet
(5760 m2) shall be provided with two separate and approved fire
apparatus access roads.

D104.3 Remoteness. Where two access roads are required, they shall be
placed a distance apart equal to not less than one half of the length of the
maximum overall diagonal dimension of the property or area to be
served, measured in a straight line between accesses.

SECTION D105
AERIAL FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

Section D105 is amended to read as follows:

DI05.1 Where required. Buildings or portions of buildings or facilities

exceeding 30 feet (9144 mm) in height above the lowest level of fire

department vehicle access shall be provided with approved fire apparatus

access roads capable of accommodating fire department aerial apparatus.

Overhead utility and power lines shall not be located within the aerial fire
apparatus access roadway.

DI05.2 Width. Fire apparatus access roads shall have a minimum
unobstructed width of 26 feet (7925 mm) in the immediate vicinity
of any building or portion of building more than 30 feet
(9144 mm) in height.

DI05.3 Proximity to building. At least one of the required access roads
meeting this condition shall be located a minimum of 15 feet (4572 mm)
and a maximum of 30 feet (9144 mm) from the building, and shall be
positioned parallel to one entire side of the building.

SECTION D106
MULTIPLE-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

Section D106 is amended to read as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 41 of 44



D106.1 Projects having more then 50 dwelling units. Multiple-family
residential projects having more then 50 dwelling units shall be provided
with two separate and approved fire apparatus access roads.

Section D106.2 is deleted.

SECTION D107
ONE- OR TWO-FAMILY RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENTS

Section D107 is amended to read as follows:
D107.1 One- or two-family dwelling residential developments.
Developments of one- and two-family dwellings where the number of
dwelling units exceeds 30 shall be provided with two separate and
approved fire apparatus access roads and shall meet the requirements of
section D104.3.
14.04.100 California Existing Building Code
California Code of Regulations Title 24 Part 10 California Existing Building Code 2007 Edition
as published by the International Code Conference International Existing Building Code Appendix
Chapter Al and is adopted by reference.
14.04.110 Reference Standard Code

The 2007 Edition of the California Reference Standard Code published by the California Building
Standard Commission is adopted by reference.

14.04.120 International Property Maintenance Code

The 2006 Edition of the International Property Maintenance Code as published by the
International Code Council is adopted by reference.

14.04.130 Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code

The 2006 Edition of the Uniform Swimming Pool, Spa and Hot Tub Code as published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical Officials, is adopted by reference and is
amended as follows:

Delete All Fee Schedules. Fee schedules shall be adopted by separate resolution of the city
council.

Ordinance No.
Page 42 of 44



14.04.140 International Existing Building Code

The 2006 Edition of the International Existing Building Code as published by International Code
Council is adopted by reference.

14.04.150 Enforcement of Fire Codes

The 2007 California Fire Code and 2006 International Fire Code as adopted and amended herein
shall be enforced by the bureau of fire prevention, in the fire department of Rancho Adobe Fire
District.

14.04.160 Non-Liability of City of Cotati

This Ordinance shall not be construed as imposing upon the City of Cotati (or any official or
employee thereof) any liability or responsibility for damages to any property or injuries to any person
resulting from defects in building construction, defective plumbing, or drainage systems (or
installations thereof), electrical or gas installations, or by installations of containers for the use of
flammable products, nor shall the City of Cotati (or any official or employee thereof) be liable or
responsible for any property damage from any cause whatsoever including but not limited to that
which may have been caused by a gas leakage, fire or explosion of any gas appliance or house gas
piping, electrical application or electrical wiring or from the storage or use of flammable and/or
hazardous materials (14.04.160).

Non-Liability of Rancho Adobe Fire District. This Ordinance shall not be construed as imposing upon
the Rancho Adobe Fire District (or any official or employee thereof) any liability or responsibility for
damages to any property or injuries to any person resulting from defects in fire protection systems, or
installation of containers for the use of flammable products, nor shall the Rancho Adobe Fire District
(or any official or employee thereof) be liable or responsible for any property damage from any cause
whatsoever including but not limited to that which may have been caused by a gas leakage, fire or
explosion of any gas appliance or house gas piping, electrical application or electrical wiring or from
the storage or use of flammable and/or hazardous materials.

14.04.170 Violations and Penalties

Any person violating any of the provisions of this Ordinance shall be deemed guilty of an infraction
and any person violating the same section or a portion of an Ordinance on a second or subsequent
occasion shall thereafter be deemed guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction of either an
infraction or a misdemeanor shall be punishable by law. The imposition of one penalty for any
violation shall not excuse the violation or permit to continue; and all such persons shall be required to
correct or remedy such violations or defects within a reasonable time; and when not otherwise
specified, each ten days that prohibited conditions are maintained shall constitute a separate offense.

14.04.180 Repeal of Conflicting Ordinances
All other Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict with this Ordinance are hereby repealed.

14.04.190 Fees
The City Council of the City of Cotati may establish permit fees as set forth by resolution.

Ordinance No.
Page 43 of 44



Section 2: Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this
ordinance is for any reason held invalid or unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity
of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City Council hereby declares that it would have
passed this and each section, subsection, phrase or clause thereof irrespective of the fact that any one
or more sections, subsections, sentence, clause, phrase or potion of this ordinance be declared
unconstitutional on their face or as applied.

Section 3: Effective Date. This Ordinance shall become effective and be in full force and effect
thirty days (30) days after its final passage.

Section 4: Posting. The City clerk shall cause this ordinance to be published and/or posted within
fifteen (15) days after its adoption in accordance with Section 36933 of the Government Code of the
State of California.

*hkkkikkhkkkikk

This ordinance was introduced on the 26th day of March 2008, and adopted on the 9th day of April
2008, by the following vote, to wit:

GILARDI:
GUARDINO:
FOX:
MINNIS:
ORCHARD:

APPROVED:
Mayor

ATTEST:

Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

City Attorney

Ordinance No.
Page 44 of 44






Item No. 4

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Adoption of a Resolution, Declaring Weeds in the City of Cotati to be a
Public Nuisance and Ordering their Abatement and Further Declaring such
Nuisance to be a Seasonal and Recurrent Nuisance Subject to Abatement
under Government Code § 39562.1, and Setting a Date for Protest Hearing.

Date: April 9, 2008

Written By: Damien O’Bid, Director of Public Works/City Engineer

Recommendation:

Move to adopt a resolution declaring weeds in the City of Cotati to be a public nuisance and
ordering their abatement and further declaring such nuisance to be a seasonal and recurrent
nuisance subject to abatement under Government Code 8§ 39562.1, and setting a date for protest
hearing.

Background:

The annual weed abatement program begins each April with the adoption of a resolution
declaring weeds to be a public nuisance and the setting of a date to receive any protests from
property owners whose properties have been listed as having the potential for needing weed
removal.

Discussion/Analysis:

This year’s program will once again be administered by City of Cotati staff. The Public Works
Department will provide property identification and inspection. Assistance from the Community
Development Department will be in the form of City Council Staff Reports, preparation of
appropriate resolutions, and public notification. The Administrative Services Department will
calculate the cost of the program, determine the charge per parcel, provide payment reconciliation
and submit unpaid accounts to the Auditor’s office for inclusion on the property tax rolls.

It is anticipated that the City will enter into a contract for actual weed removal services. City
Council is scheduled to review bids and staff recommendations for award on May 14, 2008.

Staff recommends that the Council adopt a resolution to initiate the Weed Abatement Program for
2008.

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\weedabatesetph.sr.doc



Weed Abatement
April 9, 2008
Page 2 of 2

Financial Considerations:

The Weed Abatement Program required a General Fund subsidy in the amount of $4,610.88 in
fiscal year 06-07. The required subsidy for this fiscal year is estimated to be approximately the
same.

Legal Considerations:

The attached resolution conforms to the government code and the City of Cotati Municipal Code.

Attachments:
Proposed resolution

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\weedabatesetph.sr.doc



RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF COTATI
DECLARING NOXIOUS WEEDS IN THE CITY OF COTATI TO BE A PUBLIC
NUISANCE AND ORDERING THEIR ABATEMENT AND FURTHER DECLARING
SUCH NUISANCE TO BE A SEASONAL AND RECURRENT NUISANCE SUBJECT
TO ABATEMENT UNDER GOVERNMENT CODE SECTION 39562.1, AND
SETTING DATE FOR PROTEST HEARING

WHEREAS, noxious weeds upon the street, sidewalks and private property in the City of
Cotati are a present danger to the public health and public safety; and,

WHEREAS, there are such noxious weeds on and in front of certain parcels of real
property within the City of Cotati; and,

WHEREAS, said nuisances existing upon properties described in Exhibit “A” identified
with reference to this resolution and on file in the office of the City Clerk are found to be
seasonal and recurrent nuisances within the meaning of Government Code Section 39562.1.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City Council of the City of Cotati as
follows:

1. Noxious weeds, as defined in Sections 39560 and 39561.5 of the Government
Code and in Section 8.16.020 of the Cotati Municipal Code, are hereby declared to be public
nuisances;

2. The abatement of said noxious weeds is hereby ordered in accord with Article 2,
Chapter 13, Division 3, Title 4, of the Government Code;

3. Said noxious weeds shall be abated from the parcels of said real property
described in said Exhibit “A” attached hereto and by reference made a part hereof; and seasonal
recurrent nuisances described herein shall be further abated pursuant to Section 39562.1;

4. The expenses incurred in abating said nuisance shall constitute a lien and may be
assessed upon the lot or lands from which such weeds shall have been destroyed or removed or
upon the abutting property where the weeds have been removed from the adjacent sidewalks,
parking or streets.



The hearing upon the foregoing Order of Abatement shall be held on April 23, 2008, at
the hour of 7:00 p.m., or as soon as possible thereafter, in the Council Chambers, Cotati City
Hall, 201 West Sierra Avenue, Cotati, California.

* Xk Kk %

IT ISHEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing resolution was duly introduced and legally
adopted by the City Council of the City of Cotati at a regular meeting held on the 9" day of
April, 2008, by the following vote, to wit:

GILARDI
GUARDINO
FOX
MINNIS
ORCHARD

APPROVED:

Mayor

ATTEST:

Deputy City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney

ResolutionNo.
Page 2 of 2



EXHIBIT A
Property List - 2008

APN ADDRESS LOT SIZE
046-073-006-000 597 HELMAN LN 8.48
046-111-020-000 395 HELMAN LN 1.03
046-111-021-000 363 HELMAN LN 1.02
046-111-047-000 369 BLODGETT ST 2.47
046-111-052-000 279 HELMAN LN 3.83
046-211-046-000 6 ISSEL LN 0.46
046-223-018-000 8841 OLD REDWOOD HWY 7.12
046-231-026-000 188 MYRTLE AVE 4
046-231-041-000 8864 OLD REDWOOD HWY 251
046-281-008-000 187 HELMAN LN 1.23
046-286-018-000 NONE 1.98
046-286-019-000 NONE 6.41
046-601-005-000 490 MYRTLE AVE 0.56
046-620-040-000 8684 OLD REDWOOD HWY 2.02
046-630-027-000 195 EUCALYPTUS AVE 0.92
046-630-043-000 NONE 0.04
144-010-073-000 MERCANTILE DR 0.32
144-010-074-000 MERCANTILE DR 0.33
144-030-003-000 6087 LOCUST AVE 8.88
144-040-001-000 6110 LOCUST AVE 1.22
144-040-006-000 8079 HWY 116 2.17
144-040-011-000 7515 ALDER AVE 2.17
144-040-013-000 7455 ALDER AVE 2
144-040-021-000 8145 HWY 116 3.13
144-050-004-000 8214 HWY 116 0.86
144-050-005-000 8356 HWY 116 251
144-050-009-000 NONE 7.17
144-070-028-000 WILFORD LN 0.41
144-080-001-000 7600 COMMERCE BLVD 2.81
144-080-019-000 7662 OLD REDWOOD HWY 1.56
144-080-022-000 7734 OLD REDWOOD HWY 0.45
144-090-002-000 7960 HWY 116 2.55
144-100-001-000 8028 HWY 116 7.09
144-100-002-000 8112 HWY 116 5.09
144-110-001-000 8260 HWY 116 2.86
144-110-005-000 710 W COTATI AVE 1
144-110-006-000 720 COHEN CT 1.17
144-110-007-000 740 W COTATI AVE 1.27
144-110-010-000 780 W COTATI AVE 4.58
144-120-005-000 833 RICHARDSON LN 1.03
144-120-008-000 859 RICHARDSON LN 1.25
144-120-014-000 769 RICHARDSON LN 1.25
144-120-015-000 795 RICHARDSON LN 1.25
144-120-016-000 813 RICHARDSON LN 1.26
144-120-017-000 889 RICHARDSON LN 4.04
144-120-018-000 855 RICHARDSON LN 5.04
144-120-020-000 749 RICHARDSON LN 1.14
144-120-022-000 733 SCHOOL ST 15



APN

144-120-024-000
144-120-025-000
144-130-013-000
144-130-015-000
144-130-021-000
144-130-024-000
144-140-007-000
144-151-028-000
144-151-029-000
144-151-030-000
144-151-032-000
144-161-028-000
144-170-002-000
144-170-003-000
144-170-006-000
144-170-007-000
144-170-008-000
144-170-009-000
144-190-011-000
144-190-021-000
144-190-023-000
144-190-024-000
144-190-030-000
144-200-004-000
144-200-011-000
144-210-005-000
144-210-006-000
144-210-007-000
144-210-008-000
144-210-009-000
144-210-010-000
144-220-002-000
144-220-003-000
144-220-006-000
144-220-010-000
144-220-011-000
144-220-014-000
144-220-023-000
144-230-011-000
144-230-016-000
144-230-017-000
144-230-018-000
144-230-019-000
144-230-021-000
144-230-023-000
144-230-025-000
144-241-021-000
144-241-022-000
144-241-039-000
144-250-008-000
144-250-025-000

ADDRESS
741
745
645 W
635 W
697 W

8492

310
315
335
365

8600
147
7801

150
7888
7898

7874

7971
255 W
774 W
786
780
760
770
720
714
708
674 W
696
690
666
648
480

8570

8590

8620

8565

8601
450
470
301 E
343
218 W
175 W

50 W

RICHARDSON
RICHARDSON
COTATI

COTATI

COTATI

HWY 116
SCHOOL
MAPLE

MAPLE

MAPLE

MAPLE

MAPLE

HWY 116

ST JOSEPH
OLD REDWOOD
ST JOSEPH

ST JOSEPH

ST JOSEPH
OLD REDWOOD
OLD REDWOOD
OLD REDWOOD
OLD REDWOOD
OLD REDWOOD
OLD REDWOOD
COTATI
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL

OAK

OAK

OAK

OAK

OAK

SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
SCHOOL
COTATI
SIERRA
COTATI

LN
LN
AVE
AVE
AVE

ST

AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE

WAY
HWY
WAY
WAY
WAY
HWY
HWY
HWY
HWY
HWY
HWY
AVE
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
ST
CIR
CIR
CIR
CIR
CIR
ST
ST
ST
ST
AVE
AVE
AVE

LOT SIZE
1.6

1.59

0.95

0.91

1.36

2.36

15

1.16

0.98
0.73
1.75
1.72
2.29
1.68
15
3.41
10.08
0.78
0.67
0.74
0.78
0.84
3.08
1.14
1.03
0.15
2.15
131
1
0.71
1.47
2.63
1.75
0.66
0.38
4.43
0.58
4.86
2
2.04
2.04
1.95
3.08
1
2.04
0.32
1.06
0.13
4.37
0.21



APN

144-250-027-000
144-250-028-000
144-262-009-000
144-262-017-000
144-273-007-000
144-273-009-000
144-274-014-000
144-274-015-000
144-281-010-000
144-282-009-000
144-282-030-000
144-292-026-000
144-301-008-000
144-301-012-000
144-302-022-000
144-302-029-000
144-302-030-000
144-302-048-000
144-302-050-000
144-320-008-000
144-320-012-000
144-320-015-000
144-320-016-000
144-320-018-000
144-351-004-000
144-353-012-000
144-370-002-000
144-370-006-000
144-370-007-000
144-370-023-000
144-370-024-000
144-370-025-000
144-380-006-000
144-380-007-000
144-380-011-000
144-380-012-000
144-391-007-000
144-391-008-000
144-391-011-000
144-392-006-000
144-392-009-000
144-410-004-000
144-410-019-000
144-420-001-000
144-420-004-000
144-420-024-000
144-430-001-000
144-430-002-000
144-430-009-000
144-430-012-000
144-430-013-000

ADDRESS

104 W COTATI
102 W COTATI

8188 OLAF
8160 OLAF
84 E SIERRA
8150 LA PLAZA
128 E  COTATI
120 E COTATI
395 E COTATI
279 E COTATI
190 E COTATI
690 E COTATI
955 E COTATI
COTATI
768 E  COTATI
828 E COTATI
902 E COTATI
INDUSTRIAL
766 E  COTATI
982 E COTATI
1038 E COTATI
INDUSTRIAL
INDUSTRIAL
NONE
9 PAGE
165 PAGE
8929 WATER
8655 WATER
8635 WATER
124 CERVANTES
117 CERVANTES
113 CERVANTES
8730 WATER
8790 WATER
8740 WATER
8750 WATER
8540 CYPRESS
8558 CYPRESS
300 VALPARAISO
301 VALPARAISO
190 W SIERRA
59 BENSON
85 BENSON
9020 WATER
8820 WATER
14 LOMA LINDA
8615 CYPRESS
8693 CYPRESS
25 NELSON
549 SYCAMORE
529 SYCAMORE

AVE
AVE
ST

ST

AVE
PLZ
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE

ST
ST
RD
RD
RD
CT
CT
CT
RD
RD
RD
RD
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
AVE
LN
LN
RD
RD
DR
AVE
AVE
LN
LN
LN

LOT SIZE
0.21
0.18

0.17
0.34
0.34
0.4
0.28
1
0.97
1
3.6
0.96
0.67

0.23
0.23
0.76
1.32
0.42
1.77
0.96
0.96
3.39
0.44
0.43
1.07
0.57
0.74
0.49
0.5
0.46
1

1
0.45
0.47
0.39
0.3
10.06
0.3
0.38
0.27
1.07
1.52
2.57
0.53
0.36
10.66
1.73
2.45
1.58



APN

144-440-001-000
144-450-002-000
144-450-036-000
144-450-037-000
144-450-038-000
144-450-039-000
144-450-040-000
144-450-041-000
144-450-042-000
144-450-043-000
144-460-002-000
144-460-005-000
144-460-007-000
144-460-008-000
144-460-009-000
144-460-016-000
144-460-017-000
144-460-018-000
144-460-019-000
144-470-007-000
144-480-012-000
144-480-014-000
144-480-019-000
144-480-021-000
144-650-015-000
144-650-020-000
144-680-051-000

ADDRESS
8622
100

8844
8904
8890
8866
8888
8796

65

8360

356

7820

CYPRESS
VALPARAISO
LUND HILL
LUND HILL
LUND HILL
LUND HILL
LUND HILL

LUND HILL
LUND HILL
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
LOGAN
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
CYPRESS
LASKER
INDUSTRIAL
INDUSTRIAL
INDUSTRIAL
INDUSTRIAL
AMBER
NONE

LOT SIZE

AVE 8.08
AVE 9.91
LN 0.29
LN 0.21
LN 0.19
LN 0.18
LN 0.16
0.16

LN 0.17
LN 0.19
AVE 8.17
AVE 0.29
AVE 1.25
AVE 1.25
AVE 4.22
PL 1.21
AVE 1.24
AVE 1.43
AVE 1.6
LN 1.81
AVE 0.49
AVE 1.87
AVE 0.48
AVE 0.88
LN 0.25
0.73

OLD REDWOOD HWY 1.25



Item No. 5

City Council Agenda
Consent Calendar

Subject: Adoption of a Resolution Authorizing an Application to California Debt
Limit Allocation Committee for a $3.2 Million Bond Allocation to Permit
Issuance of Qualified Mortgage Credit Certificates throughout Sonoma
County and All of its Nine Cities.

Date: April 9, 2008

Written By: Jone Hayes, Director of Administrative Services

Recommendation

It is recommended by the Department of Administrative Services that the City Council approve a
Resolution authorizing an application to California Debt Limit Allocation Committee for a $3.2
million bond allocation to permit issuance of qualified Mortgage Credit Certificates throughout
Sonoma County and all of its nine cities.

Background

In 1994, the City of Cotati approved a Cooperative Agreement with the SCCDC, as did the cities of
Cloverdale, Healdsburg, Petaluma, Rohnert Park, Santa Rosa, Sebastopol, Sonoma and the Town of
Windsor for the purpose of applying as a County to CDLAC for Mortgage Revenue Bond Single
Family Allocation authority (Single Family Allocation) to fund a Mortgage Credit Certificate
(MCC) program. The MCC program provides an annual tax credit for homebuyers, thus reducing
the amount of Federal income tax they pay, which increases their disposable income and enables
them to more easily qualify for a mortgage loan. The rapid escalation of real estate values in
Sonoma County since inception of the MCC Program has resulted in a small supply of homes
available for sale within the permitted MCC purchase price limits ($573,890 for new homes and
$453,200 for resale homes). As a result, only 4 first-time homebuyers have utilized the Program
since 2005.

Reduction of the County’s Single Family Allocation from $40 million in 1993 to just $1.8 million
in 2007, also led to difficulties in implementing a cost-effective local MCC program. In response to
these two factors, the CDC and participating cities sought alternate ways to use the Single Family
Allocation funds to assist County residents. Sonoma County became an Associate Member of
California Rural Home Mortgage Finance Authority Homebuyer Fund (CHF) in June 2007, and
assigned its 2007 Single Family Allocation to CHF to increase the funds available to assist first-
time homebuyers through CHF’s programs. To date, one Sonoma County household has been
assisted through the CHF programs.

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\Mortgage Credit Certificates.sr.doc



Analysis/ Discussion

The 2008 Single Family Allocation for Sonoma County has increased to $3,197,908, an amount
sufficient to assist 13 to 16 first-time homebuyers. The increased amount of this year’s allocation
from CDLAC, combined with reduced real estate values and tightened availability of mortgage
financing for many first-time homebuyers, make it appear desirable and feasible to operate an
effective local MCC program for the current year. The MCC Committee, comprised of
representatives from the Commission and all nine incorporated jurisdictions, met on March 10,
2008 and recommended an application to apply for the $3.2 million Sonoma County Single Family
Allocation to renew operation of a local MCC Program in 2008. The nine city/town councils
subsequently adopted resolutions confirming their desire to participate with the County in a
renewed local MCC Program.

If the County does not apply for its $3.2 million Single Family Allocation for 2008 to implement a
local MCC program or assign its 2008 Allocation to CHF, the Allocation will revert to California
Housing Finance Agency (CalHFA) for use in statewide homebuyer programs.

The attached Resolution authorizes the Commission to apply for $3.2 million in MCC authority for
2008.

Financial Considerations

None.

Environmental Issues

None.

Attachments:
Proposed resolution

H:\CCREPORTS\2008\20080409\Mortgage Credit Certificates.sr.doc



RESOLUTION NO.

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF COTATI
AUTHORIZING THE SONOMA COUNTY COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
COMMISSION’S APPLICATION TO THE CALIFORNIA DEBT LIMIT ALLOCATION
COMMISSION TO PERMIT ISSUANCE OF QUALIFIED MORTGAGE CREDIT
CERTIFICATES THROUGHOUT SONOMA COUNTY

WHEREAS, there is a need for affordable homeownership opportunities within the County of
Sonoma (County), particularly for households with low and moderate incomes; and

WHEREAS, the issuance of Mortgage Credit Certificates (“MCC”) to individual homebuyers
throughout Sonoma County has been shown to enhance the affordability of both new and existing homes
within statutory limits; and

WHEREAS, the California Health and Safety Code Sections 50197.1 et seq. (the “Act”)
authorizes “...a redevelopment agency, housing authority, or other local entity, authorized by state law to
issue qualified mortgage bonds...” to create and participate in MCC Programs; and

WHEREAS, Section 8869.85 of the Government Code requires a local agency to file an
application for a portion of the state ceiling with or upon the direction of the California Debt Limit
Allocation Committee (“CDLAC”) prior to the issuance of qualified mortgage bonds or mortgage credit
certificates; and

WHEREAS, the Sonoma County Community Development Commission (“CDC”) has
previously entered into Cooperative Agreements with the County, and the cities of Cloverdale, Cotati,
Healdsburg, Petaluma, Rohnert Park, Santa Rosa, Sebastopol, Sonoma, and the Town of Windsor (the
“Cities”) pursuant to which CDC applied to CDLAC for mortgage revenue bond Single Family
Allocation authority for a Mortgage Credit Certificate (MCC) program; and

WHEREAS, the Cities wish to continue to cooperate with one another for the purposes of the
MCC Program and have requested that all of the CDC’s MCC allocations be available to eligible first-
time homebuyers within their respective corporate limits; and

WHEREAS, a security deposit of up to $100,000 (maximum security deposit required for an
MCC allocation) has been set aside in a local interest bearing account by the CDC only to be released to
CDLAC if the CDC is unable to issue one (1) MCC; and

WHEREAS, the CDC continues to have the capacity to administer a local MCC Program.
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the City of Cotati that:

1. The Executive Director of the CDC is authorized to make immediate application to
the CDLAC for a 2008 mortgage bond allocation in an amount up to $3.2 million.

2. The Executive Director of the CDC is authorized to make application to the CDLAC
in future years for additional mortgage bond allocations in amounts as
determined annually by CDLAC.



3. The Executive Director of the CDC is authorized to execute and/or amend the
cooperative agreements with the cities of Cloverdale, Cotati, Healdsburg, Petaluma,
Rohnert Park, Santa Rosa, Sebastopol, Sonoma, and the Town of Windsor, which
have requested the continued use of MCC allocations within their corporate limits.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT the City Council does hereby direct the Executive Director to
execute and deliver such other documents and to take such further actions as may be necessary to carry
out the purpose and intent of this Resolution.

* k% %

IT ISHEREBY CERTIFIED that the foregoing Resolution was duly introduced and legally adopted by
the City Council of the City of Cotati at a regular meeting held on the 9th day of April, 2008 by the
following vote, to wit:

GILARDI:
GUARDINO:
FOX:
MINNIS:
ORCHARD:

Approved:

Mayor
Alttest:

Deputy City Clerk

Approved as to form:

City Attorney

Resolution No.
Page 2 of 2



